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LINKING AGREEMENT
BETWEEN
THE CITY OF GLENDALE, ARIZONA
AND
CREATIVE COMMUNICATIONS SALES & RENTALS, INC.

THIS LINKING AGREEMENT (this “Agreement”) is entered into as of this 2L day of
Frfl 20 4, between the City of Glendale, an Arizona municipal cotporation (the “City”), and
Creatlve Communications Sales & Rentals, Inc., an Arizona corporatlon authotized to do business in
Arizona (“Contractor”), collectively, the ¢ Partles

RECITALS

A. On November 29, 2012, under the Arizona State Purchasing Cooperative Purchasing
Agreement, the State of Arizona entered into a contract with Contractor to purchase the
goods and services described in the Installation and Repair of Two Way Radios Contract,

Contract No. ADSP013-036883 (“Cooperative Purchasing Agreement”), which is attached -

hereto as Exhibit A. The Cooperative Purchasing Agreement permits its cooperatlve use’by
other governmental agencies including the City.

B. Section 2-149 of the City’s Procurement Code permits the Materials Manager to ptocure |

goods and services by patticipating with other governmental units in cooperative purchasing
agreements when the best interests of the City would be served.

C. Section 2-149 also provides that the Matetials Manager may enter into such cooperative

agreements without meeting the formal or informal solicitation and bid requirements of

Glendale City Code Sections 2-145 and 2-146.

D. The City desires to contract with Contractor for supplies or services identical, or nearly
identical, to the supplies or services Contractor is providing other units of government under
the Cooperative Purchasing Agreement. Contractor consents to the City’s utilization of the
Cooperative Purchasing Agreement as the basis of this Agteement, and Contractor desires to
enter into this Agreement to provide the supplies and services set forth in this Agreement.

AGREEMENT

NOW, THEREFORE, in consideration of the foregoing recitals, which are incorporated by
reference, and the covenants and promises contained in this Linking Agreement, the parties agree as
follows: :

1. Term of Agreement. The City is purchasing the supplies and/or services from Contractor

pursuant to the Cooperative Purchasing Agreement. According to the Cooperative

Purchasing Agreement award and rate sheet, which are attached hereto as part of Exhibit B,
purchases can be made by governmental entities from the date of award, which was
November 29, 2012, until the date the contract expires on November, 28, 2016, unless the
term of the Cooperative Purchasing Agreement is extended by the mutual agreement of the
original contracting parties. The Cooperative Purchasing Agreement, however, may not be



extended beyond November 28, 2017. The initial period of this Agreement, therefore, is the
period from the Effective Date of this Agreement until November 28, 2016. If the term of
the Cooperative Purchasing Agreement is extended, the City Manager or designee may
renew the term of this Agreement for one-year period periods until the Cooperative
Purchasing Agreement expires on November 28, 2017. Renewals are not automatic and
shall only occur if the City gives the Contractor notice of its intent to renew. The City may
give the Contractor notice of its intent to renew this Agreement 30 days prior to the
anniversary of the Effective Date to effectuate such renewal. 8

Scope of Work; Terms, Conditions, and Specifications.

A, Contractor shall provide City the supplies and/or services identified in the Scope of
Work attached as Exhibit C.

B. Contractor agrees to comply with all the terms, conditions and specifications of the
Cooperative Purchasing Agreement. Such terms, conditions and specifications. are
specifically incorporated into and are an enforceable patt of this Agreement.

Compensation.

A. City shall pay Contractor compensation at the same rate and on the same schedule as
the Cooperative Purchasing Agreement, unless the City and Contractor agree to a
different schedule, as provided in Exhibit D.

B. The total purchase price for the supplies and/or services purchased under this -
Agreement shall not exceed Fifty-Five Thousand Three Hundred Fifty One-dollars -
(855,351) for the entire term of the Agreement (initial term plus any renewal terms
exercised).

Cancellation. This Agreement may be cancelled pursuant to A.R.S. § 38-511.

Non-discrimination. Contractor must not disctiminate against any employee or applicant for
employment on the basis of race, color, religion, sex, national origin, age, marital status,
sexual orientation, gender identity or expression, genetic characteristics, familial status, U.S.
military veteran status or any disability. Contractor will require any Sub-contractor to be
bound to the same requirements as stated within this section. Contractor, and on behalf of
any subcontractors, watrants compliance with this section. :

Insurance Certificate. A certificate of insurance applying to this Agreement must be
provided to the City ptior to the Effective Date.

E-verify. Contractor complies with A.RS. § 23-214 and agrees to comply with the
requirements of A.R.S. § 41-4401.
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8. Notices.  Any notices that must be provided under this Agreement shall be sent to the
Parties’ respective authorized representatives at the address listed below:

City of Glendale
c/o Jeff Henry
6210 W. Myrtle Avenue, Building S
Glendale, Arizona 85301
623-930-3516

and

Creative Communications Sales & Rentals, Inc.
c¢/o Nick Spino

3332 E. Broadway Road
Phoenix, AZ 85040

IN WITNESS WHEREOTF, the parties hereto have executed this Agreement as of the date and year
set forth above.

“City” “Contractot”

City of Glendale, an Arizona Creative Communications Sales & Rentals,’y

municipal corporation Inc., an Arizona corporation

b B Bilai AW, W“’W&WX‘ :
Kevin R. Phelps Name Jacquehrlt/ S. Weisenburger o
City Manager Title:  Chief Operating Officer

ATTEST:

\_L ,@/MN&(L&%/‘L/A/V\

Pamela Hanna (SEAL)

City Cletk

APPROVED AS TO FORM:

MichxeLD/ Bailey.
City Attorney T~
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LINKING AGREEMENT
BETWEEN
THE CITY OF GLENDALE, ARIZONA
AND
CREATIVE COMUNICATIONS SALES & RENTALS, INC.

EXHIBIT A

State of Arizona Contract No. ADSP013-036883 - Purchase and Installation of Two Way Radios
and acessories, and Airtime Commercial Repeater Service three Sites

9/22/15



State of Arizona - Master Blanket

Master Blanket Purchase Order

Header Information

Purchase Order
Number:

Status:

/,ADSPO13-036883/ i
3PS - Sent
2013

Fiscal Year:

State of Arizona

ADSPO - Stats Procurement
Office

Organization:
Department;

Alternate ID:

Days ARO: 0

Print Dest Detail:  if Different

Catalog ID:

Randy Williams (602)542-5143
Randy.Williams@azdoa.gov

Contact
Instructions:

Master
Bianket/Contract
End Date
{(Maximum):

Project No.:
Building Code:
Cost Code:

Special Purchase
Types:

PiJ NUMBER:

Coop Spend To
Date:

Commodity
Reference ld:

PO External Doc

11/28/2017 11:58:58 PM

LD Fwy s‘f"i

ADSPOYIG36883

Release o

Number:

Purchaser: Randy
Williams

PO Type;  Blanket

Location:  SPO-State
Procurement
Office

Entered 1172912012

Date: 02:23:51 PM

Retainage 0.00% .

%:

Release Direct

Type: Release

Tax Rate:

Recelpt
Method:

Minor
Status:

Type Code:

Control
Code:

Discount %:

Pcard
Enabled:

Actual Cost:

Page 1 of 5

Statewide .-

0.00% "

Yes'..

so.oal L

Type:
Agency PO Terms & Conditious -
Attachments: file~1.zip Change Order

Summar

%23 pdf Creative Commun COI -

Expires 5.1,14~1.pdf Offer and A

- infor

ange Qrdur.

Summary 3 - ADSPO13. eswas_n onal Guide.pdf
Ciiange Crder Summary 4 {jf Catalog ang Pricing- g reative .

Commugl

ion 2.6.14.2in C hamt urdsr

nmar No 8 ADSPO13-036883.doc COI -

Expires 5.1.20185.

pdf Chanue Qrder Sunp

Coptragt Renewal.odi Change Order




Sta}te of Arizona - Master Blanket

Summary No .7 AD&P

Page20f5

18 doe 12,715,404 Updated

Hotorola Cataloy -

Loof Ghange Order |

Sunmary No .8 M):SPO

1S%‘§ WE

Professional Li‘a.t‘mff
ADSPO12-036883 -
Catalog12.19.2014 '»d

mm&tw’e“ﬁ{:m"
Reheaterlssae 2045

-*wm um«m , f

State Radio Referanc

FCULChangs Ortirf

Summary No.13 ADSP(

fres 5.9 "816 pdi

Chanae Order Sumimare Mo, 1 ALS

stk

Vendor
Attachments:

Agency Attachment
Forms:

Vendor Attachment
Forms:

Primary Yendor information & PO Torms

BestWay -

Vendor: Payment  Net30 Shipping
Terms: Method: Co
Jacki Bals Shipping  As Specified Freight Freight
3332 E. Broadway Rd. Terrr:lpw g Te"gs. Prepaid - .- -
Phoenix, AZ 85040 ' ) and :
us Charged -
Emait: Back
jacki.bals@creativecorm.com L
Phone: (602)855-8405
FAX: (602)855-1049 o
PO ocument 91 Notifications Acknowledged DatefTime | :
Acknowledgements: . ———]
» Purchase Emailed to jacki.bals@creativecom.com at 12/06/2012 11:40:14 AM: | . .
Order 12/06/2012 D8:54:57 AM o
Change Emailed to jacki bals@creativecom.comat | 01/04/2013 09:11:19AM |
Order 1 12/21/2012 12:11:59 PM L
Change Emailed to jacki.bals@creativecom.com at 10/02/2013 04:44:09 ‘PM 1.
Order 2 10/02/2013 03:18:26 PM oy
Change Emailed to jacki.bals@creativecom.com at 12/13/2013 03:11:01 PM
Order 3 12/12/2013 05:13:49 PM ‘ .
Change Emailed to jacki.bals@creativecom.com at 02/07/2014 09:47:29 AM. .
Order 4 02/06/2014 02:52:37 PM 1
Change Emailed to scott.okrasinski@creativecom.com at | 04/10/2014 02:57:11 PM.
Order § 04/10/2014 02:18:34 PM S
Change Emailed to scott.okrasinski@creativecom.com at | 08/15/2014 09:22:03 AM 1
Order 6 08/08/2014 10:43:15 AM R &
Chénge . Emailed {o scoti.ckrasinski@creativecom.com at
Order 7 12/18/2014 08:50:14 AM .
Change Emailed to scott.okrasinski@creativecom.com at | 12/18/2014 02:58:06 PM.
Order 8 12/18/2014 08:52:18 AM ' '
Change Emailed to scott.okrasinski@creativecom.com at
Order 9 01/22/2015 08:58:15 AM o
Change Emailed to scott.okrasinski@creativecom.com at | 01/27/2015 03:40:31 PM’ |
Order 10 01/26/2015 09:26:43 AM y
Change Emailed to scott.okrasinski@creativecom.com at | 04/02/2015 11:44:24-AM |
Order 11 04/02/2015 10:41:44 AM |
Change Emailed to scott.okrasinski@creativecom.com at
Order 12 07M16/2015 10:31:13 AM ,
Change Emailed to scott.okrasinski@creativecom.com at | 07/20/2015 02:45:02: PM |
Order 13 07/20/2015 12:19:01 PM o .
Change Emailed to scott.okrasinski@creativecom.com at | 08/25/2015 04:14:44 PM ‘
Order 14 08/25/2015 12:55:52 PM




Stgte of Arizona - Master Blanket

Page 3 of 5 -

Document Notifications Acknowledged Date/T lmé L
Change Emailed to scott.okrasinski@creativecom.com at | 02/05/2016 10:58:26'AM
Order 15 02/05/2016 06.:56:16 AM

Master Blanket/iContract Vendor Distributor List

e i Alternative . . Preferred
2000001321 PZ2000001381 | CREATIVE COMMUNICATIONS SALES | Email
AND RENTALS INC

f4aster Blanket/Contract Controls

Master Blanket/Contract Begin Date: 11/29/2012 Master Blanket/Contract End Date: 11/28/2016':} o

Cooperative Purchasing Allowed: Yes
Organization Department Dollar Dotiars Spent to Minimum Order

Limit Date Amount:
ALL ORG - Organization Umbrella | AGY - Agency Umbrella $0.00 $435,001.55 i 50‘.00',
Master Control Master Control :
fem informetion

11-150f 44
Le345R1IAY

L

Print Sequence # 22.0, item # 11:

Group # 3 Desk-Top Analog & Digital Base Station Radio Equipment SPS -
-(Extended Maintenance & Support ) Bid shall represent a per YEAR ~ Sent '
charge for Extended Maintenance & Support .Group specifications SR B
are referenced in the scope of work page page page 11-section § et

NIGP Code: 726-88
Two-Way Radio, Portable, Including Vehicle Radio Relay Systems

Bid #/ Bid ltem # ADSP013-00002123/22 Quote # / Quote Item #: 00601403475 /22 o
Recsipt Method | Qty | Unit Cost UOM Discount % | Total Discount Amt. | Tax Rate Tax Amount | Total Cost : ’
Quantity 0.0 $0.001 | EA - Each 0.00 $0.00 $0.00 ‘ $0‘00' 17

Manufacturer: Brand: Model:

Make: Packaging:

Project No.:

Building Code:

Cost Code:

Property Number:

NIGP Code: 726-88

Print Sequence # 23.0, item # 1

Two-Way Radio, Portable, Including Vehicle Radio Relay Systems

2: Group # 3 Desk-Top Analog & Digital Base Station Radio Equipment 3PS-.| . °
- (Labor for Repair) Bid shall represent a par HOUR price for ali non
warranty labor for repair and service. Group specifications are
refarenced in the scope of work page page page 11 section §

Receipt Method | Qty [ Unit Cost | UOM | Discount % | Total Discount Amt. | Tax Rate | Tax Amount | Total Cost 1
Quantity 0.0] $80.00 | HR - Hour 0.00 $0.00 $0.00  $0.‘00 :
Manufacturer. Brand: Model:

Make: Packaging:

Project No.:

Sent|. 1




State of Arizona - Master Blanket Pége 4 of 5

Building Code:
Cost Code:
Property Number:

Print Sequence # 24.0, item # 13; Group # 3 Desk-Top Analog & Digital Base Station Radio Equipment 3PS -
-(User License per site) Bid shall represent a per SITE price for User  Sent |-
License (per site), Group specifications are referenced in the scope of -
work page page page 11 section 5 ‘

NIGP Code: 726-88 :
Two-Way Radio, Portable, including Vehicle Radic Relay Systems

Bid #/ Bid ttem #. AD$PQ13-00002133/24 Quote #/ Quote Item # 003114983-R27 / 24

Receipt Method | Qty | Unit Cost UOM Discount % | Total Discount Amt. | Tax Rate | Tax Amount | Total Cost _‘;3_‘
Quantity 0.0 $0.001 | EA - Each 0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0,00> 1. ;
Manufacturer: Brand: Model:

Make: Packaging:

Project No.

Building Code:

Cost Code:

Property Number:

Print Sequence # 25.0, ltem # 14: Group # 3 Desk-Top Analog & Digital Base Station Radio Equipment - 3PS -4,
- (User License per site) Bid shall represent a per SITE price for User  “Sent { "
License (per site). Group specifications are referenced in the scope of
work page page page 11 section §

NIGF Code: 726-88
Two-Way Radio, Portable, Including Vehicle Radio Relay Systems

Bid #/ Bid tem #: ZDZF013-00002133/25 Quote £/ Quote ltem #: G010 5372125

Receipt Method | Qty | Unit Cost UOM Discount % | Total Discount Amt. | Tax Rate | Tax Amount | Total Cost
Quantity 00| $0.001 | EA- Each 0.00 $0.00 $0.00 |  $0.00
Manufacturer: Brand: Model:

Make: Packaging:

Project No.:

Building Code:

Cost Code:

Property Number:

Print Sequence # 26.0, item # 15: Group # 3 Desk-Top Analog & Digital Base Station Radlo Equipment 3PS- |
- (System License muitiple sites) Bid shall represent a System - Sent |
License for multiple sites. Group specifications are referenced in the- :
scope of work page page page 11 section 5

NIGP Code: 726-88
Two-Way Radio, Portable, Including Vehicle Radio Relay Systems

Bid #/ Bid ltem #: ADSPC13-00002133/26 Quote # / Quote ltem #: CO014uB3-72 /26

Receipt Method | Qty | Unit Cost| UOM | Discount % | Totai Discount Amt. | Tax Rate | Tex Amount TotaE.Cost_ 1

Quantity 0.0 $0.001 | EA - Each 0.00 $0.00 $0.0C $0.00_"

Manufacturer. Brand: Model:




State of Arizona - Master Blanket

Make:

Project No.:
Building Code:
Cost Code:
Property Number:

Packaging:

Page S of 5

Copyright © 2016 Periscope Holdings, Inc. - All Rights Reserved. AZ-PAS3




Offer 1214¢-01 -~ Septemper 27, 2012 In raznomse co SEP garber ADSPO13-00002153

Offer and Acceptance

State of Arizona
. AD . pace | State Procurement Office
SOLICITATION NO.: ARSPO13-00002133 3 | 100 N,15th Ave., Sulte 201
Phoenix, AZ 85007
Crcative Communications oF '
OFFFEROR: Sales and Rentais, Inc. 57
OFFER
TO THE STATE OF ARIZONA:
The Undersigned hereby offers and agraes to fumish the matensl, sorvies or construction In com with &l -terms, -

coriaitions, spacifications and amendments in the Solicitetion and any witttan axoceptions I the ofier. Signature also certifics
Srnall Buginass status.

Arizona Transaction (Sales) Privilege Tax License No.:

e

Federel Eraployar Identification io.: E-mail; Jacki.Balsecreativecon. com
861646517 602-555-B405

Phona:

£y 603-955-1049

Creative Communications Sales «nd Rentals, Inc. %(S%’;ﬁ“
K

netura of Parson Authorized io Sign Oﬂer -

Comparry Neme
3332 E. Broadway Road Jacqueliine S. Balse
Address Printed Name
Phoenix Arizona 85040 Chief Operating Officer
City Slale Zip Title

By signature in the Offer section above, the Offeror certifies:

1. The submission of the Offer did nol involve collusion or other enticompetitive practices.
2, The Offeror shall not discriminate against any emplayce o applicant for employraent in viclation of Fzderal Expcutive Order 11248, State Executive Order
2009-09 or A.R.S. §§ 41-1421 through 1466,

3. Tive Ofieror has nal given, offered to give, nor intends to give al any time hateafter any economic oppartunity, fuiure amployment, gifi, loan, grulty, apecial
discount, Irip, favcr, or service to a public scrvant in connection with-the submitied offer, Fallure to pravide & valid signature affiming the stipulations required
by thia clause shall result in reiaction of 15:9 offer. Signing the offer with & false stoternant shall vold the offer, any resulting contract and may beub;ed o
legial remedies provided by .

4. The Offaror cartities that tha above referenced organization _X_IS7___iS KOT a small busiaess \ith kess than 100 employses or has gross revenues of $4
midioit or less. :

5. In gecordance with A.R.S, §35-393, the oficror hereby sertifies that the Offaror doas 1io! heve scrutinized husiness opergtions in lran.
8. In aceordance with A.R.S, §35-381, the offarcr hereby certifies that the Offeror does not have scnutinized business operations in Sudan,

ACCEPTANCE OF OFFER

The Offer I hereby accepted.
The Contractor is now bound to ssll the materials or services dsted by the attached contrct and besed upen the eolcﬁalion.
including all terms, conditicns, specifications, amendments, eto,, and the Contractor's Ofisr as accepted by the Stete.

mncmasmummnnbemmmammuo L
AO’/PN o (FEEET . The Contractor has bean cautioriad not to commence any
billabie work or to provlde any material or service under this contract until Contracior raceives purchase order, contact mloase

documant or written notice to proceed.

8tzlo of Arizons

Awnrdsd this 529"!’ dey of a)onrm—_&g zo 13
797: . "zzi'/f

Procurament Officer




Special Terms and Conditions

Solicitation No.: ADSPO13-00002133 PAGE

QF

Description: Two-Way Radios 57

2.2

23

24

i/ 26

2.7

2.8

2.9

210

31

case of confiict with the applicable requirements stated in the solicitation as amended or the Contractor's proposal. In all
other matters not affected by the written clarification, if any, the solicitation shall govern.

The State’s primary contact for this solicitation and result contracts shall be:

James U. Reeves, Sr, Procurement Specialist
State of Arizona, State Procurement Office
100 N 15" Ave, Suite 201

Phoenix, AZ 85007

Phone: (602) 542-9121

Fax:  (802) 542-5508

Email: james reeves@azdoa.qov

Contract Document. The State may clarify any Contract following award. This clarification shall not substantially aiter the -
contents of the Contract, but shall only edit and reformat the Contract in a manner that will facilitate ease of use, contract -
administration, and concurrence of the Parties.

Contract Type. Hourly Rate, Firm Fixed Price. Individual Task Assignmenis shall be awarded on a specific prOJect basvs in . e

accordance with the terms of this Contract.

Term of Contract. The term of the contract shall commence upon award and shall remain in effect fora penod of one year oL
unless terminated, canceled or extended as otherwise provided herein. :

ontract Extension. The initial contract term is for a one (1) year period subject to additional successive perlods of a . S
maximum twelve months per extension with a maximum aggregate including all extensions not to exceed five (5) years.. A~
factor in contract extensions shall be the extent that the State has all current usage information and insurance- documents i
on file. .

Estimated Usage. The Contract shall be on an as needed, if needed basis. The State makes no guarantee as to the i
amount of usage that may occur under a resultant contract. .

Non:-Exclusive Conftract. This contract has been awarded with the understanding and agreement that it'is. for the:sole-:

convenience of the State of Arizona. The State reserves the right to obtain like goods or services from another source when .- "

necessary. Off-contract purchase authorization(s) may be approved by either the agency (within an agencies delegated .
authority) or by the State Procurement Office. Approvals shall be at the exclusive discretion of the State and shalt be ﬁnat .
Off-contract procurement shall be consistent with the Arizona Procurement Code. . Pl

Eligible Agencies. This contract shall be for the use of all State of Arizona departments, agencies, commissions and -
boards. In addition, eligible universities, political subdivisions and nonprofit educational or public health institutions may
participate at their discretion. In order to participate in this contract, a university, political subdivision, or nonprofit -
educational or public heaith institution shall have entered into a Cooperative Purchasing Agreement with the Department of
Administration, State Procurement Office as required by Arizona Revised Statutes 41-2632. .

Cancellation. The State reserves the right to cancel the whole or any part of the contract due to failure of the Contractor to. - o -

carry out any term, promise, or condition of the contract including but not limited to:

2.10.1  Providing personnel that do not meet the requirements of the contract or attempting to impose on the State. IR s

personnel of unacceptable quality,
2.10.2 Failure to perform adeguately the services required in the contract or
2.10.3 Any action or inaction that is in viclation of EPA, OSHA or any appiicable regulation.

ADMINISTRATIVE FEE / USAGE.

Contractor shall assess an administrative fee in the amount of one (1%) against all contract sales to members of the
State Purchasing Cooperative ~ including cities, counties, school districts and other qualified members. The
administrative fee is calculated against all sales under this contract minus any taxes or regulatory fees, minus any~retums
or credits, and minus any shipping charges not already included in the unit prices. An updated list of State Purchasing
Cooperative members may be found at http:/spo.az.gov/iCooperative ni/SPC/default.asp. Atits optlon the
State may expand the applicability of this fee. The State shall provide thirty (30) written notice pnor to exerc:smg orv .

changing this option.

State of Arizona .
State Procurement Office
27 100 N.15th Ave., Suite 201 -
Phoenix, AZ 85007.. *




Arizona De;ﬁartﬁient of

Contract Change Order Summary Administration’

State Procurement Office - -
100 N. 15" Avenue, Suite 201
Change Order No.. 10 Date: April 2, 2015 Phoenix, AZ 55007

Contract No.: «ContractBlanket_»

Two-Way Radio

Creative Communications Sales and Rentals

1. Inaccordance with Uniform Terms and Conditions Paragraph 5.1, Amendments, the above menhoned contract 15 :
hereby amended as follows: o

a. The catalogs entitled ‘Creative Airtime Commercial Repeater Usage 2013’ shall be iepiéced with -
catalog entitied "Creative Airtime Commercial Repeater Usage 2015, The updated catalog shall: be v
within the Attachments tab of ProcureAZ. : . e

ALL OTHER REQUIREMENTS, SPECIFICATIONS, TERMS AND CONDITIONS REMAIN UNQHANG'EI;J.

ALL QOTHER: REQUiREMENTS SPECIFICATIONS, TERMS AND CONDITIONS REMAIN UNCHANGED
e ( EJ\;EML- NT AND: AUTHDR?ZATIO

Tms change order shall be fully executad upon the approval electronically in ProcureAZ hy an authonze
of the Contractor and applied to the contract in ProcureAZ by the Procurement Officer.or dele

Available online at

Procure. AZ.Gov Page |1




Contract Change Order Summary State of mom :

State Procurement Office
Contract No.: ADSPO13-036883 100 N. 18™ Avenue, Suite 201 -

Phoenix, AZ 85007

Change Order No.: 11 Date: June 4, 2018

I. In accordance with Special Terms and Conditions Paragraph 2.6, Contract Extension, the above mentioned contract isi hereby '
amended as follows; '

The Contract Term is hereby extended through November 28, 2016.

ALL OTHER RE QUIREMENTS SPECIFICATIONS TERMS AND CONDIT]ONQ REMA UN C ]

representative of the Contractor and applied to the contract by the Procurement Officer ot delegate. :

Available online at

1of
Procure. AZ gov Page 1 of 1

Contract Change Order Summary




LINKING AGREEMENT
BETWEEN
THE CITY OF GLENDALE, ARIZONA
AND
CREATIVE COMMUNICATIONS SALES & RENTALS, INC.

EXHIBIT B
Award and Rate Sheet

9/22/15



Contract#: ADSPO13-036883
Creative Communications
State of Arizona, Two-Way Radio Contract
Contract Term, annual: 11/29/14 - 11/28/15 (1-yr extensions through 11/29/17)

Group 1: Analog & Digital Vehicular Mounted Mobile Radios

e Main Line Radio Discount: 38%.off of list
¢  Accessories and Order Options: 15% off of list
¢ Repair Parts: 10% off of list
e Service Repair: $90.00/hour
Group 3: Desktop, Analog & Digital Base Radios
e Main Line Radio Discount: 38% off of list
e Accessories and Order Options: 15% off of list
o Repair Parts: 10% off of list
o Service Repair: $90.00/hour
Group 4: Analog & Digital Portable Radios ,
s Main Line Radio Discount: 389% off of list
e Accessories and Order Options: 15% off of list
o Repair Parts: 10%off of list
e Service Repair: $90.00/hour
Group 6: Analog & Digital Base/iviobile Relay Station Fixed Radio {repeaters)
@ Main Line Radio Discount: 32% off of list
@ Accessories and Order Options: 15% off of list
%  Repair Parts: 10% off of list
¢ Service Repair: $90.00/hour
Group 8: Fixed Link Base Radios
@ Main Line Radio Discount: 25% off of list
#  Accessories and Order Options: 10% off of list
& Repair Parts: (no bid, no contract)
o Service Repair: $90.00/hour
Group 9: Low Power, Vehicular Repeater
e Main Line Radio Discount: 35% off of list
‘s Accessories and Order Options: 15% off of list
¢ Repair Parts: (no bid, no contract)
e Service Repair: $90.00/hour
items NOY on Creative’s state contract, and must be bid as MR:
Group 2: Mobile Data Radio, Vehicular Mounted {no bid, no contract)
Group 5: Motorcycle Radios {no bid, no contract)
Group 7: Communication Service Monitors {no bid, no contract)

Group 10: Multi-Band Radios {no bid, no contract)
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U.S. Profeszionat Prics Pages - MOTOTREO

Mobiles - Page 21 XPR™ 5550 & XPR™ 5580
Date 1/5/15 VHF, UKF & B0OC/900MHz MOBILES
SUGGESTED RETAIL OPTIONS

1 BAND SPUT ] BAND 1 PWR I CHAN Iumoa MODEL MSA!

KPR 5550 Color Display with Bluetooth, GPS, and Expansion Card W
1Bea7aMHz | WHF 125w 1000 JAAM2EINNSKAL N -$as2.00l o
16174mHz | ik | 2545w 1000 [AAM2BIGNSKAL_N $o48.00} *
403470MHz | UMEF 1-25W 1000 |AAMBONNSKALN $93200)
403-470MHz | UHF 25-40W 1000 |AAMZBQPNIKAL N goo8.00| . -
450-512MHz | UWF 1-40w 1000 |AAMZETRNGKAI_N $ssn.00

8N | 1035W (800} .
7 q Wl Mz | O | ot | 000 [aamasummscar $998.00]

FOC INFORMATION: VHF 25W ABZISFTI0RG; VHF 45W ABZOOFTICE?. UHF 25W: ABZIOFTA087; UHF 40W: ABZSUFT4088; UHFZ: ABZS9IFTA08S5; 800/S00MHZ: AZ452FTSE62. e

[options: 70 COMPLETE AN DRDER YOU MUST CHOOSE ONE (1) OPTION FROM EACH STEF BELOW ]

STDMICOS11  Standard Compact Microphone for VHF & UNF {RMNS052) nNfc :

STOMICO205  Standard Compact Microphone for 800/900MHz (RMN5052) NfC - % -

GADOO3E Heavy Duty Microphone {RMN5053) - 83180 -

QAD2406 impres 4-way Navigation Keypad Mic (RMNS127) $120.00

QAD4996 MOTOTRBO Handheld Control Head with 8.5ft Colled Cable $534.00 i

B71 Omit Microphone +$1000 . - :

,
nlcos: o

STDEKTOS11  Standard Mounting Bracket fer VHF & UHF (Low Profife - RLN5463) NfC -

STDBKTO203  Standard Mounting Bracket for 800/S00MHz {Low Profile - RLN6469) ‘NfC

B6S Omit Standard Mounting Bracket -$4.00

Cable Choloes: {Optional RKN4136 Ignition Switch Cable Is required for installations requiring ignition sense)

STDCBLOS11  Standard Power Cable for VHF & UHF (HKN4191) NEo

STDCBLOZ03  Standard Power Cable for B00/G00MHz (HKN4191} Rfc . -
B161 Ormit Standard Power Cable $8.00°
Shioplng Bow Choloes: S
STOBLKOSIL  Standard Model Box for VHF & UHF Neo T
STDBLKO203  Standard Mode! Bex fur 800/900MH:z NfC
B842 Butk Packing {minimum 2 radios per box} - NfC

STEP 5:

The XPR Serles moblles ship with a Standard 2-yeer perts and labor warranty, Additionally, they ship standard with a 1- yesr Service from the Start -UTE {SfS) option for 3 years of
total coverage, The 1- year of SFS-UTE coverage can be omitted by selecting the GADOA64 option, which would provide only 2 years of standard warranty coverage. Additiona) Sf5-1
optlons are also available in the General Options section. Loal Services ane not ineluded, contact your Customer Support Menager 1o place units on a Local Support Contract.

STDRSADS11 Standard 2 Year Warranty + 1 Year Service from the Start -UTE {3 years of coverage} for VHF & UHF - Nfe
STDRSAD2ZO2 Standard 2 Year Wasranty + 1 Year Service from the Start -UTE {3 years of coverage} for 800/900MHz N/C. ¢
GADC164 Orit 1 Year Service from the Start -UTE {Omitting this option would provide 2 years -$11.00
of standard warranty} FO )

anequm Software Feature: ) Ix
For more Information, please refer to the Software License section. -
HKVN4A24S MOTOTREO Permahent Discoverable & Data Transfer Services via Bluetooth sso.ob :
HKVN4281 Text to Speech for Channels, Zones, Programmable Buttons, Text Messages, and Job Tickets

$1060




U8, Professional Price Pagas - MOTOTRBO

Portables - Page 27 XPR™ 7550 & XPR™ 7580
Date 1/5/15 VHF, UHF & 800/900MHz PORTABLES
SUGGESTED RETAIL OPTIONS R :
BAND SPLIT BAND I PWR CHAN _|CATALOGMODEL ‘ f » ~MJW :
XPA™ 7550 & XPR 7580 Display with Color Disglay, GPS, Bluetooth, Expansion Card SR
1W to 5W o ol
BEITAMAz | VHE | owy | 1000 [AAHSSIDNSKAL N S $L123ml_
W toaw =
43512Mb | UHE | L i | 3000 [AaeseRoNsKkal w L _smssm] .
5 ~>| s069a1Miz | 8007900 ;“”"’if:’ 1000 |AAHSEUCNOKEI_N L $1.1.55ml 5

FOC INFORMATION VHF; ABZ9SFTI085, UHF1/2: ABZBIFTADBS, B00/900: ABZSOFTS014

[Options: YO COMPLETE AN ORDER YOU MUST MAKE ONE (1) CHOICE PER EAGH STER RN

STEP 1:
STDBATO871  Standard Battery - IMPRES Lidon, 2150 mAh, 7.2V, Submersible (IP57) Battery (PMNN4403) ‘ 0 N
QA02300 IMPRES Li-ion, 1500 mah, 7.2V, Submersible {IP57) Battery Slim (FMNN4407} : ~$1667
QAG2308 IMPRES Li-ion, 2300 mAh, 7.2V, Submersible (IPS7) Battery - Intrinsically Safe FM (NNTN8129} * CL L $s000 s
QAO4472 Li-ion, 1300 mAh, 7.2V, Low Temp -30C, Long Life {IPS7) Battery (PMNN435) N
Q04474 IMPRES Hi-Cap Li-ion, 2700 mAh, 7.2V, Submersible {IP57) Battery (PMNN44483) T 45833
STDBATO126  Standard Battery - IMPRES Li-ion, 2150 mAh, 7.2V, Submersible (IP57) Battery (PMNN4409) S N
QAO2300 IMPRES Li-ion, 1500 mAh, 7.2V, Submersible (IP57) Battery Slim (PMNN4407} Sy - $1687
QAU23089 IMPRES LHon, 2300 mah, 7.2V, Submersible (IP57) Battery - Intrinsically Safe FM (NNTNB129) * .o $spo0 ol
QAD4472 Li-ian, 1300 mAh, 7.2V, Low Temp-30C, Long Life {IP57) Battery (PMNN4435) SoseLer.

QAD474 IMPRES H-Cap Li-ion, 2700 mAh, 7.2V, Submenrsible (IP57) Bettery [PMNNA4448} T $58.33
*The KPR 7350, JPR 7550, XPRY380 and XPRISE0 Intrinsically safe, FM Approved, portable radio units MUST be ordered and shipped

mm’mmmmqnmos-ummmmus,wmmwumwum»m in accordance with
Canada and US Codes as intrinsically safe for use in Class I, 1, 1il, Diviston 1, Groups C,D,E.F,G, and Division 2, Class 1, Groups A,8,C;D.

VHF.UHF Charger Cholces:
STOCHG0871  Standard Charger - IMPRES Single Unit Charger with Switch Mode Power Supply {WPLNG232) . R
He51 Omit Standard Charger e v'»" ,
00MH2 H [ L
STDCHG0126  Standard Charger - IMPRES Single Unit Charger with Switeh Mode Power Supply {WPLN4232) R 7 S

H851 Omit Standard Charger s "-Lsz.om

_ o
DN :

NQTE: The XPR7S50 & XPR7580 1ns are equipped with an integrated GPS antenna and do not require a secondary external GPS

VHF Antentia Options o T
QA02299 VHF Helical Antenna 136-155 MHz (PMAD4117) e N
QAD2308 VHF Helkal Antennn 144-165 MHz (PMADA4116) o SUUNfE
QAG2310 VHF Helical Antenna 152-174 MHz (PMAD4118) ‘ CULLUNE
0A02307 VHF Stubby Antenna 136-148 MHz {PMADA119) SEI 7
QAO2305 VHF Stubby Antenna 160-174 MHz (PMAD4121} e NC .
QA02306 VHF Stubby Antenna 146-160 MKz (PMAD4120) L Lo Ne
UHNF Antenna Options: L

QA02304 UHF Silm Whip Antenna 403-527 MHz (PMAE4075} L
0A02303 UHF Stubby Antenna 403-450 MHz (PMAE4069) o N
QA02302 UHF Stubby Antenna 440490 Mtz (PMAE4070) T N T
QA02301 UHF Stubby Antenna 470-512 MHz {PMAE4071) ‘ CURLoNE T
800/9000Hz Antenna Options: oL
QA01915 800MMz Whip Antenna 805-870 MHz (PMAF4011) SN
0AD1916 500MHz Whip Antenna 896-941 MHz (PMA£4012) % L
0AD1419 800 MHz Stubby Antenna 806-870 MHz 12cm {PMAF4009) - NE
QA01420 900 MHz Stubby Antenna 896-941 MHz 11cm (PMAF4010) * < NfC

* Note: This antenna Is optimized for 900 MHz but can be used for mixed 300 £900 MHz channels or sites.

Hi12 Ot Standerd Antenna R

=




LINKING AGREEMENT
BETWEEN
THE CITY OF GLENDALE, ARIZONA
AND
CREATIVE COMMUNICATIONS SALES & RENTALS, INC

EXHIBIT C
Scope of Work

PROJECT

Creative Communications Sales & Rentals, Inc. will provide two-way radios, accessories, installation

and repair of two-way radios for Transit. Purchase and installation is to be completed no later than
June 30, 2016. .

Creative Communications Sales & Rentals, Inc. will provide airtime commercial repeater setvice fof
three sites for 44 two-way radios beginning July 1, 2016 at the rate of $20 per month (plus tax), per
radio through November 28, 2016 for a total of $4 794.

Creative Communications Sales & Rentals, Inc. will provide airtime commercial repeater service for
three sites for 44 two-way radios beginning November 28, 2016 through June 30, 2017 at the rate of
$20 per month (plus tax), per radio for a total of $6,712.

Creative Communications Sales & Rentals, Inc. will provide aittime commercial repeater service for

three sites for 44 two-way radios beginning July 1, 2017 through November 28, 2017 at the rate of -
$20 per month (plus tax) per month, per radio for a total of $4,840.

9/22/15



LINKING AGREEMENT
BETWEEN
THE CITY OF GLENDALE, ARIZONA
AND
CREATIVE COMMUNICATIONS SALES & RENTALS, INC.

EXHIBIT D
METHOD AND AMOUNT OF COMPENSATION

Method of payment is provided under Compensation in the Agteement. The amount of

compensation, including installation of products and services is provided in the rate sheet and award :

pursuant to the State of Arizona No. ADSP013-036883 and attached hereto.
NOT TO EXCEED AMOUNT

The total amount of compensation paid to Contractor for full completion of all work requiréd by
the Project must not exceed $55,351 for the entite term of the Agreement (initial term plus any
renewal terms exercised).

DETAILED PROJECT COMPENSATION

Creative Communications Sales & Rentals, Tnc. will provide two-way radios, accessoties, installation
and repair of two-way radios for Transit. Purchase and installation is to be completed no later than
June 30, 2016.

Creative Communications Sales & Rentals, Inc. will provide airtime commercial repeater service for
three sites for 44 two-way radios beginning July 1, 2016 at the rate of $20 per month (plus tax) pet
radio through November 28, 2016 for a total of $4 794.

Creative Communications Sales & Rentals, Inc. will provide airtime commercial repeater service for
three sites for 44 two-way radios beginning November 28, 2016 through June 30, 2017 at the rate of
$20 per month (plus tax), pet radio for a total of $6,712.

Creative Communications Sales & Rentals, Inc. will provide airtime commercial repeater service for

three sites for 44 two-way radios beginning July 1, 2017 through November 28, 2017 at the rate of ‘
$20 per month (plus tax) per month, per radio for a total of $4,840.

9/22_/15





