CITY CLERK

> C-8996
@%%@gwé&i 06/26/2014

AGREEMENT WITH
CREATIVE COMMUNICATIONS SALES & RENTALS, INC.
FOR
Installation and Repaits on Two~Way Radios

This Agreement for the installation and repairs on two-way radios ("Agreement") is effective and entered into
between CITY OF GLENDALE, an Arizona municipal corporation ("City"), and Creative Communications Sales

&Re Inc., an Arizona corporation, authorized to do business in Arizona, (the "Contractor"), as of the
dayoﬁ :‘7@{]4 L_ 2014,

RECITALS

A City intends to undertake a project for the benefit of the public and with public funds that is more fully set
forth in Exhibit A, pursuant to Solicitation No. ADSPO13-036883 with the State of Arizona (the
"Project”);

B. City desires to retain the services of Contractor to perform those specific duties and produce the specific
work as set forth in the Project attached hereto;

C City and Contractor desire to memorialize their agreement with this document.

AGREEMENT

In consideration of the Recitals, which are confirmed as true and correct and incorporated by this reference, the
mutual promises and covenants contained in this Agreement, and other good and valuable consideration, City and
Contractor agree as follows:

1. Key Personnel; Sub-contractors.

1.1 Services. Contractor will provide all services necessary to assure the Project is completed timely
and efficiently consistent with Project requirements, including, but not limited to, working in close
Interaction and interfacing with City and its designated employees, and working closely with others,
including other contractors or consultants, retained by City.

12 Project Team.

a Project Manager.

(1) Contractor will designate an employee as Project Manager with sufficient training,
knowledge, and experience to, in the City’s option, complete the Project and
handle all aspects of the Project such that the work produced by Contractor is
consistent with applicable standards as detailed in this Agreement;

@ The City must approve the designated Project Manager; and

3 To assure the Project schedule is met; Project Manager may be required to devote
10 less than a specific amount of time as set out in Exhibit A.

b. Project Team.

® The Project manager and all other employees assigned to the project by
Contractor will comprise the "Project Team."

] Project Manager will have responsibility for and will supervise all other employees
assigned to the project by Contractor.

©)] Consultant will provide a Project Team to perform all work necessary to complete
the Project.
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@ Consultant cettifies that members of the Project Team meet ot exceed the level of
competence that the City may reasonably expect of a person petforming his o her
assigned duties, and that he or she will not commit any acts or omissions
detrimental to the development, implementation ot completion of the Project.

c. Sub-contractors.
@ Conttactor may engage specific technical contractor (each a "Sub-contractor”) to
furnish certain service functions.
) Contractor will remain fully responsible for Sub-contractor’s setvices.
3 Sub-contractors must be approved by the City, unless the Sub-contractor was

previously mentioned in the tesponse to the solicitation.

6 Contractor shall certify by lettet that contracts with Sub-contractots have been
executed incorporating requitements and standards as set forth in this Agreement.

Schedule. The services will be undertaken in a manner that ensures the Project is completed timely and
efficiently in accordance with the Project.

Contractor’s Work.

31 Standard. Contractor must perform setvices in accordance with the standards of due diligence,
care, and quality prevailing among contractors having substantial expetience with the successful
furnishing of services for projects that are equivalent in size, scope, quality, and other criteria under
the Project and identified in this Agreement.

3.2 Licensing. Contractor warrants that:

a, Conttactor and Sub-contractors will hold all appropriate and required licenses, registrations
and other approvals necessaty for the lawful futnishing of services ("Approvals"); and

b. Neither Contractor nor any Sub-contractor has been debarred or otherwise legally
excluded from contracting with any federal, state, or local governmental entity
("Debarment”).

€y City is under no obligation to ascertain or confirm the existence ot issuance of any
Approvals or Debarments ot to examine Contractot's contracting ability.

()] Contractot must notify City immediately if any Approvals or Debatment changes
duting the Agreement's duration and the failure of the Contractor to notify City as
required will constitute a matetial default under the Agreement.

3.3 Compliance. Setvices will be furnished in compliance with applicable federal, state, county and
local statutes, rules, regulations, ordinances, building codes, life safety codes, and other standards
and ctiteria designated by City.

3.4 Coordination; Interaction.

a. For projects that the City believes requires the coordination of vatrious professional
services, Contractor will work in close consultation with City to proactively interact with
any othet professionals retained by City on the Project ("Coordinating Project
Professionals").

b. Subject to any limitations expressly stated in the Project Budget, Contractor will meet to
review the Project, Schedule, Project Budget, and in-progtess work with Coordinating
Project Professionals and City as often and for durations as City reasonably considets
necessaty in order to ensure the timely wotk delivery and Project completion.

c For projects not involving Coordinating Project Professionals, Contractor will proactively
interact with any other contractors when directed by City to obtain ot disseminate timely
information for the proper execution of the Project.
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35 Wotk Product.

a. Ownership. Upon teceipt of payment for services furnished, Contractor grants to City,
and will cause its Sub-contractots to grant to the City, the exclusive ownership of and all
copytights, if any, to evaluations, reports, drawings, specifications, project manuals,
sutveys, estimates, reviews, minutes, all "architectural work" as defined in the United States
Copyright Act, 17 U.S.C § 101, ez s¢4., and other intellectual work product as may be
applicable ("Work Product").

(1) This grant is effective whethet the Wotk Product is on paper (e.g., a "hard copy”),
in electronic format, ot in some othet form.

)] Contractor warrants, and agrees to indemnify, hold harmless and defend City for,
from and against any claim that any Work Product infringes on third-party
proptietaty interests.

b. Delivery. Contractor will deliver to City copies of the preliminary and completed Work

Product promptly as they ate prepared.
c. City Use.
1) City may reuse the Work Product at its sole discretion.

2 In the event the Work Product is used for another project without further
consultations with Contractot, the City agtees to indemnify and hold Contractor
harmless from any claim arising out of the Wotk Product.

3 In such case, City shall also remove any seal and title block from the Work
Product.

Compensation for the Project.

4.1 Compensation. Contractor's compensation for the Project, including those furnished by its Sub-
contractors will not exceed $40,000.00 for the entire potential term (Initial Term and any renewals)
of this Agreement as provide in Section 13 below, and as specifically detailed in Exhibit B (the
"Compensation").

4.2 Changes in Scope of Project. The Compensation may be equitably adjusted if the originally
contemplated scope of setvices as outlined in the Project is significantly modified.

a. Adjustments to the Compensation requite a written amendment to this Agreement and
may require City Council approval.
b. Additional services which are outside the scope of the Project contained in this Agreement
may not be performed by the Contractor without prior written authorization from the City.
Billings and Payment.
5.1 Applications.
a. Contractor will submit monthly invoices (each, a "Payment Application") to City's Project
Manager and City will remit payments based upon the Payment Application as stated
below.

b. The petiod covered by each Payment Application will be one calendar month ending on
the last day of the month ot as specified in the solicitation,

5.2 Payment,
a. After a full and complete Payment Application is teceived, City will process and temit
payment within 30 days.
b. Payment may be subject to or conditioned upon City's receipt of:
(1) Completed wotk generated by Contractor and its Sub-contractors; and
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2 Unconditional waivers and releases on final payment from Sub-contractors as City
may reasonably request to assute the Project will be free of claims arising from
required performances under this Agreement.

53 Review and Withholding. City's Project Manager Will timely review and certify Payment

Applications.
a. If the Payment Application is rejected, the Project Manager will issue a written listing of
the items not approved for payment.
b. City may withhold an amount sufficient to pay expenses that City reasonably expects to
incur in correcting the deficiency or deficiencies rejected for payment.
Termination.
6.1 For Convenience. City may terminate this Agreement for convenience, without cause, by

delivering a written termination notice stating the effective termination date, which may not be less
than 30 days following the date of delivety.

a.

Contractor will be equitably compensated for Service and Repair furnished prior to receipt
of the termination notice and for reasonable costs incurred.

Contractor will also be similarly compensated for any approved effort expended and
approved costs incutred that are directly associated with project closeout and delivery of
the required items to the City.

6.2 For Cause. City may terminate this Agreement for cause if Contractor fails to cure any breach of
this Agreement within seven days after receipt of written notice specifying the breach.

a.

Contractor will not be entitled to furthet payment until after City has determined its
damages. If City's damages resulting from the breach, as determined by City, are less than
the equitable amount due but not paid Contractor for Service and Repair furnished, City
will pay the amount due to Contractor, less City's damages, in accordance with the
provision of § 5.

If City's direct damages exceed amounts otherwise due to Contractor, Contractot must pay
the difference to City immediately upon demand; however, Contractor will not be subject
to consequential damages of mote than §1,000,000 or the amount of this Agreement,
whichever is greater.

Conflict. Contractor acknowledges this Agreement is subject to A.R.S. § 38-511, which allows for
cancellation of this Agreement in the event any person who is significantly involved in initiating,
negotiating, securing, drafting, or creating the Agreement on City's behalf is also an employee, agent, or
consultant of any other patty to this Agreement.

Insurance,

8.1 Requirements. Contractot must obtain and maintain the following insurance ("Required
Insurance"):

a.

Contractor and Sub-contractors. Conttractor, and each Sub-contractor performing work or
providing materials related to this Agreement must procute and maintain the insurance
coverages desctibed below (collectively referred to hetein as the "Contractor's Policies"),
until each Party's obligations under this Agreement are completed.

General Liability,

(1) Contractor must at all times relevant hereto carry a commercial general liability
policy with a combined single limit of at least $1,000,000 per occurrence and
$2,000,000 annual aggregate for each property damage and contractual property
damage.
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h.

7)) Sub-contactors must at all times relevant heteto catry a general commetcial liability
policy with a combined single limit of at least $1,000,000 per occurtrence.

3 This commercial general liability insurance must include independent contractors’
liability, contractual liability, broad form propetty coverage, XCU hazards if
requested by the City, and a separation of insurance provision.

4 These limits may be met through 2 combination of primary and excess liability
covetage.

Auto. A business auto policy providing a liability limit of at least $1,000,000 per accident
for Contractor and $1,000,000 per accident for Sub-conttactots and coveting owned, non-
owned and hired automobiles.

Workers' Compensation and Employet's Liability. Conttactot and sub-contractor must, at
all times relevant heteto, catty 2 workers' compensation and employer's liability policy
providing at least the minimum benefits required by Atizona law.

Notice of Changes. Conttactot's Policies must provide for not less than 30 days' advance
written notice to City Representative of:

(1) Cancellation ot termination of Contractor ot Sub-contractot's Policies;

@ Reduction of the coverage limits of any of Contractot or and Sub-contractot's
Policies; and

3 Any other material modification of Contractor or Sub-contractor's Policies related

to this Agreement.
Certificates of Insurance.

(1) Within 10 business days after the execution of the Agreement, Contractor must
deliver to City Representative certificates of insurance for each of Contractor and
Sub-contractor's Policies, which will confirm the existence or issuance of
Contractor and Sub-contractor's Policies in accordance with the provisions of this
section, and copies of the endorsements of Contractor and Sub-contractor's
Policies in accordance with the provisions of this section.

) City is and will be under no obligation either to ascettain or confirm the existence
ot issuance of Contractor and Sub-contractot's Policies, ot to examine Conttactor
and Sub-contractor’s Policies, ot to inform Contractor or Sub-contractor in the
event that any coverage does not comply with the requirements of this section.

3 Contractor's failure to secute and maintain Contractor Policies and to assure Sub-
contractor policies as required will constitute a material default under the
Agreement.

Other Contractors ot Vendors.

m Other contractots or vendors that may be contracted with in connection with the
Project must procure and maintain insurance coverage as is approptiate to their
patticular contract.

)] This insurance coverage must comply with the requirements set forth above for

Contractor's Policies (e.g., the requirements pettaining to endotsements to name
the parties as additional insured parties and cettificates of insurance).

Policies. Except with respect to wotkers' compensation and employet's liability coverages,
City must be named and propetly endotsed as additional insureds on all liability policies
trequired by this section.
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) The coverage extended to additional insuteds must be primary and must not
contribute with any insurance or self insutance policies or programs maintained by
the additional insureds,

) All insurance policies obtained pursuant to this section must be with companies
legally authorized to do business in the State of Atizona and reasonably acceptable
to all parties.

8.2 Sub-contractots.

a.

Contractor must also cause its Sub-contractors to obtain and maintain the Required
Insurance.

City may consider waiving these insurance requitements for a specific Sub-contractor if
City is satisfied the amounts required are not commercially available to the Sub-contractor
and the insurance the Sub-contractor does have is appropriate for the Sub-contractor's
work under this Agreement.

Contractor and Sub-contractors must provide to the City proof of the Required Insurance
whenever requested.

8.3 Indemnification.

a.

To the fullest extent permitted by law, Contractor must defend, indemnify, and hold
harmless City and its elected officials, officets, employees and agents (each, an
"Indemnified Patty," collectively, the "Indemnified Parties"), for, from, and against any and
all claims, demands, actions, damages, judgments, settlements, petsonal injury (including
sickness, disease, death, and bodily hatm), property damage (including loss of use),
infringement, governmental action and all othet losses and expenses, including attorneys'
fees and litigation expenses (each, a "Demand or Expense"; collectively, "Demands ot
Expenses") asserted by a third-party (i.e. 2 person or entity other than City or Contractot)
and that arises out of or results from the breach of this Agteement by the Conttactor ot
the Contractot’s negligent actions, etrots ot omissions (including any Sub-contractor or
other person or firm employed by Contractot), whether sustained before or after
completion of the Project.

This indemnity and hold harmless provision applies even if a Demand or Expense is in
patt due to the Indemnified Party's negligence or breach of a responsibility under this
Agteement, but in that event, Conttactor shall be liable only to the extent the Demand or
Expense results from the negligence ot breach of a responsibility of Contractor or of any
person or entity for whom Contractor is responsible.

Contractot is not required to indemnify any Indemnified Parties fot, from, or against any
Demand or Expense resulting from the Indetnnified Patty's sole negligence or other fault
solely attributable to the Indemnified Party.

Immigration Law Compliance.

9.1 Contractor, and on behalf of any subcontractor, wattants, to the extent applicable under A.R.S. §
41-4401, compliance with all federal immigration laws and regulations that relate to theit employees
as well as compliance with A.R.S. § 23-214(A) which requires registration and participation with the
E-Verify Program.

9.2 Any breach of warranty under subsection 9.1 above is considered a matetial breach of this
Agreement and is subject to penalties up to and including termination of this Agreement.

9.3 City retains the legal right to inspect the papets of any Contractor ot subcontractor employee who
performs work under this Agreement to ensure that the Contractot or any subcontractor is
compliant with the watranty under subsection 9.1 above.
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10.

9.4

9.5

9.6

9.7

City may conduct random inspections, and upon request of City, Conitractor shall provide copies of
papets and recotds of Contractor demonstrating continued compliance with the warranty under
subsection 9.1 above. Contractor agrees to keep papets and records available for inspection by the
City during notmal business hours and will cooperate with City in exercise of its statutory duties
and not deny access to its business premises or applicable papers or records for the putposes of
enforcement of this section.

Contractor agrees to incorporate into any subcontracts under this Agreement the same obligations
imposed upon Contractor and expressly accrue those obligations directly to the benefit of the City.
Contractor also agtees to require any subcontractot to incorporate into each of its own
subcontracts under this Agreement the same obligations above and expressly accrue those
obligations to the benefit of the City.

Contractor’s watranty and obligations under this section to the City is continuing throughout the
term of this Agreement or until such time as the City determines, in its sole discretion, that Atizona
law has been modified in that compliance with this section is no longer a requitement.

The “E-Verify Program” above means the employment verification program administered by the
United States Department of Homeland Security, the Social Secutity Administration, or any
successor program,

Notices.

10.1

10.2

A notice, request ot othet communication that is tequited ot petmitted under this Agreement (each
a "Notice") will be effective only if:

a The Notice is in writing; and

b. Delivered in person or by overnight coutier setvice (delivery charges prepaid), certified ot
registered mail (return receipt requested); and

c Notice will be deemed to have been delivered to the petson, to whom it is addressed as of
the date of receipt, if:

1) Received on a business day, or befote 5:00 p.m., at the address for Notices
identified for the Party in this Agreement by U.S. Mail, hand delivery, or ovetnight
coutier service on ot before 5:00 p.m,; or

) As of the next business day after receipt, if received after 5:00 p.m.

d. The burden of proof of the place and time of delivety is upon the Party giving the Notice;
and

e. Digitalized signatutes and copies of sighatutes will have the same effect as otiginal
signatures.

Representatives.

a. Contractor. Contractor's representative (the "Contractot's Representative") authorized to
act on Contractor's behalf with respect to the Project, and his or her address for Notice
delivery is:

Cteative Communications Sales & Rentals, Inc.
¢/ o Jacqueline S. Bals

3332 E. Broadway Road, Suite 101

Phoenix, AZ 85040

b. City. City's representative ("City's Representative") authotized to act on City's behalf, and
his ot her address for Notice delivery is:

City of Glendale
¢/o Bill Stetling

(Revised July 1, 2013)




11.

City of Glendale

6210 W. Myrtle Avenue, Suite #111
Glendale, Arizona 85301
623-930-2619

With required copy to:
City Managet City Attorney
City of Glendale City of Glendale
5850 West Glendale Avenue 5850 West Glendale Avenue
Glendale, Arizona 85301 Glendale, Arizona 85301
c Concurrent Notices.

(1) All notices to City's representative must be given concurrently to City Manager
and City Attorney.

@ A notice will not be deemed to have been received by City's representative until
the time that it has also been received by City Manager and City Attotney.

3 City may appoint one ot mote designees for the putpose of receiving notice by
delivery of a written notice to Contractor identifying the designee(s) and their
respective addresses for notices.

d. Changes. Contractot ot City may change its representative or information on Notice, by
giving Notice of the change in accordance with this section at least ten days prior to the
change.

Financing Assignment. City may assign this Agreement to any City-affiliated entity, including a non-
profit corporation or other entity whose primary purpose is to own ot manage the Project.

Entire Agreement; Survival; Counterparts; Signatutes.

121  Integtation. This Agreement contains, except as stated below, the entire agreement between City
and Contractor and supersedes all prior conversations and negotiations between the parties
regarding the Project or this Agreement.

a. Neither Party has made any representations, warranties ot agreements as to any mattets
concetning the Agreement's subject matter.

b. Representations, statements, conditions, or warranties not contained in this Agreement will
not be binding on the parties.

c The solicitation, any addendums and the response submitted by the Contractor ate

incotporated into this Agreement as if attached hereto. Any Contractor response modifies
the original solicitation as stated. Inconsistencies between the solicitation, any addendums
and the response or any excetpts attached as Exhibit A and this Agreement will be
tesolved by the terms and conditions stated in this Agreement.

122 Interpretation,

a. The parties fairly negotiated the Agteement's provisions to the extent they believed
necessaty and with the legal representation they deemed appropxiate.

b. The patties are of equal bargaining position and this Agreement must be construed equally
between the parties without consideration of which of the patties may have drafted this
Agreement.

c. The Agreement will be interpreted in accotdance with the laws of the State of Arizona.

123  Survival Except as specifically provided otherwise in this Agteement, each watranty,
tepresentation, indemnification and hold harmless provision, insutance requirement, and every
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14.

other tight, remedy and responsibility of a Patty, will survive completion of the Project, or the
earlier termination of this Agreement.

124  Amendment. No amendment to this Agreement will be binding unless in writing and executed by
the parties. Any amendment may be subject to City Council approval. Electronic signature blocks
do not constitute execution.

12.5  Remedies. All rights and remedies provided in this Agreement are cumulative and the exercise of
any one ot more right or remedy will not affect any other rights or remedies under this Agreement
ot applicable law.

12.6  Severability. If any provision of this Agreement is voided or found unenforceable, that
detetmination will not affect the validity of the other provisions, and the voided ot unenforceable
provision will be deemed reformed to conform to applicable law.

127  Counterparts. This Agreement may be executed in counterparts, and all counterparts will together
comptise one instrament.

Term. The City is purchasing the setvice to install products and repairs on two-way tradios from
Contractor pursuant to State of Arizona No.ADSPO13-036883. Under the State of Atizona, purchases can
be made by governmental entities from the date of award, which was November 29, 2012, until the date the
contract expires on November 28, 2014, unless such contract is extended by the mutual agreement of the
State and the Contractor. The State of Arizona, howevet, may not extend the contract beyond November
28,2017, The initial period of this Agreement is thetefore is the petiod from the Effective Date of this
Agreement until November 28, 2014. If the State and the Contractot extend their contract, the City, may
theteafter renew the term of this Agreement for three (3) one-year petiods until the State of Arizona
contract expires on November 28, 2017. Renewals ate not automatic and shall only occur if the City gives
the Contractor notice of its intent to renew. The City may give the Contractor notice of its intent to renew
this Agreement 30 days ptiot to the anniversary of the Effective Date to effectuate such a one-year renewal.

Dispute Resolution. Each claim, controversy and dispute (each a “Dispute”) between Contractor and
City will be resolved in accordance with Exhibit C. The final determination will be made by the City.

Exhibits. The following exhibits, with tefetence to the tetm in which they are first referenced, are
incorpotated by this reference.

Exhibit A Project
Exhibit B Compensation
Exhibit C Dispute Resolution
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The parties enter into this Agreement as of the effective date shown above.

City of Glendale,
an Arizona municipal corporation

=l Tttrne. Agn —
Lbpte -

é{: Brenda §. Fischer
TNy

Its: City Managet

m?ﬁ,,A

Cit Clerk (SEAL)

APPROVED AS TO FORM:

ML\
Michzel D). Bailey
City Attorney

Creative Communications Sales & Rentals, Inc.,
An Arizona corporation

sl Sty

By: ]chueh.tbg Bals

Its: Chief Operating Officer
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EXHIBIT A
AGREEMENT WITH
CREATIVE COMMUNICATIONS SALES & RENTALS, INC.
FOR

Installation and Repairs on Two~Way Radios

In accordance with the terms and conditions of this Agreement and the rate sheet and award pursuant to the State
of Arizona Contract No ADSPO13-036883, the City is agreeing to purchase installation and repairs on two—way
radios.




EXHIBIT B
AGREEMENT WITH
CREATIVE COMMUNICATIONS SALES & RENTALS, INC.
FOR
Installation and Repaits on Two-Way Radios

COMPENSATION

METHOD AND AMOUNT OF COMPENSATION

Method of payment is provided in Paragraph 5 of the Agreement. The amount of compensation, including
installation of products and setvices, is ptovided in the rate sheet and award putsuant to the State of Arizona No-
ADSPO13-036883 and attached hereto.

NOT-TO-EXCEED AMOUNT

The total amount of compensation paid to Contractor fot full completion of all work required by the Project during
the entite term (the Initial Term and any renewal terms) of the Project must not exceed $40,000.00.

DETAILED PROJECT COMPENSATION

Installed and repairs on two—way radios, on an as-needed basis.




state of Arizona - Master Blanket

[y

Blanket/Contract

R{Maximum):

Master Blanket Purchase Order ADSP0Q13-036883

Header Information

End Date 11/28/2017 11:59:59 PM
Project o=
Building Code:
Cost Code:

Special Purchase
Types:
PlJ NUMBER:

Coop Spend To
Date:

Attachments: PO Terms & Conditions, Two-Way Radio REP~1.pdf, Two-Way Radio P

Purchase Order ADSPO13-036883 Release 0 Short Two-Way Radio
Number: . Number: . Description:
Status: 3PS - Sent Purchaser: Suz Williams Receipt Quantity
Method:
Fiscal Year: 2013 PO Type: Blanket Minor Status: :
Organization: State of Arizona S
Department: ADSPO - State Pracurement Office Location: SPO - State Statewide § |
Procurement g !
Office
Alternate ID: Entered Date: 11/29/2012 Control Code:
02:23:51 PM ‘
Days ARO: 0 Retainage %: 0.00% Discount %:  0.00% ,
Print Dest Detail: If Different
Catalog ID: Release Direct Release Pcard Enahled: Yes i
Type: '
| Contact Suzi.Willams@azdoa.gov Tax Rate: Actual Cost:  $0.00

ocurement file~4.zip, Change Order

Summary 2 - ADSP0O13-036883.pdf, Creative Commun COl - Expires 5.1

.14~1.pdf, Offer and Acceptance_ ADSPO13-

036883.pdf, Change Order Summary 3 - ADSPO13-036883.pdf, Impact P

rice Catalog - Informational Guide.pdf,

Change Order Summary 4 - ADSPO13-036883.pdf, Catalog and Pri

cing-Creative Communication 2.6.14.zip, Change

QOrder Summary No .5 ADSPO13-036883.doc, COl - Expires 5.1.2015.pdf

Primary Vendor Information & PO Terms

Vendor: 9000001391 - CREATIVE Pavment Net 30 Shipping Best Way
COMMUNICATIONS SALES AND Te|¥mS' Met‘l’l%d"
RENTALS INC ’ )
Jacki Bals
3332 E. Broadway Rd. . .
Phoenix, AZ 85040 Shipping As Specified Freight Terms: Freight Prepaid
us Terms: and Charged

Email: jacki.bals@creativecom.com
Phone: (602)955-8405
FAX: (602)955-1049

PO

Back



state of Arizona - Master Blanket

Acknowledgements: . . .
9 Document Notifications Acknowledged Date/Time

Purchase Order Emailed to jacki.bals@creativecom.com at 12/06/2012 12/06/2012 11:40:14 AM
08:54:57 AM

Change Order 1 Emailed to jacki.bals@creativecom.com at 12/21/2012 01/04/2013 09:11:19 AM
12:11:59 PM

Change Order 2 Emailed to jacki.bals@creativecom.com at 10/02/2013 10/02/2013 04:44:08 PM X
03:18:26 PM

Change Order 3 Emailed to jacki.bals@creativecom.com at 12/12/2013 12/13/2013 03:11:01 PM
05:13:49 PM

Change Order 4 Emailed to jacki.bals@creativecom.com at 02/06/2014 02/07/2014 09:47:29 AM
02:52:37 PM

Purchase Order Emailed to scott.okrasinski@creativecom com at 04/10/2014 02:57:11 PM

04/10/2014 02:18:34 PM

Master Blanket/Contract Vendor Distributor List

Alternative Preferred Vendor
Vendor ID ID Vendor Name Delivery Method  Distributor Status
9000001391 18606465170 CREATIVE COMMUNICATIONS SALES  Email Active

AND RENTALS INC

Master Blanket/Contract Controls

Master Blanket/Contract Begin Date: 11/29/2012 Master Blanket/Contract End Date: 1128/2014  §
Cooperative Purchasing Allowed: Yes S g
Organization Department Dollar Dollars Spentto Minimum Order
Limit Date Amount
ALL ORG - Organization Umbrella AGY - Agency Umbrella Master $0.00 $160,300 00 $0.00
Master Control Control
item Information

| 1-5 of 44

Print Sequence # 1.0, Item # 1: Group # 1 Analog & Digital Vehicular Mounted Mobile Radio Equipment - Bid Is to represent 38% 3PS -
discount off of catalog pricing. Group specifications are referenced in the scope of work page 5§ Sent
section 3.

NIGP Code: 726-88
Two-Way Radio, Portable, Including Vehicle Radio Relay Systems

Bid #/ Bid ltem # ADSPQ13-00002133/1 Quote #/ Quote ltem#: 000014083-R2 /1

Receipt Method Qty  Unit Cost uom Discount % Total Discount Amt. Tax Rate Tax Amount Total Cost
Quantity 0.0 $0.00 EA-Each 0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 .
Manufacturer: Brand: Model:
; Make: Packaging:
g Project No.:
{ Building Code:
i Cost Code:
}
Print Sequence # 2.0, ltem # 2: Group # 1 - Analog & Digital Vehicular Mounted Mobile Radio Equipment (Accessories & 3PS -
Options) Bid shall represent 16% off of catalog pricing for Accessories & Options. Group Sent

i
|
:i specifications are referenced In the scope of work page 5 section 3
!
]



Contract#: ADSP0O13-036883
Creative Communications
State of Arizona, Two-Way Radio Contract
Contract Term, annual: 11/29/13 — 11/29/14 (1-yr extensions through 11/29/17)

Group 1: Analog & Digital Vehicular Mounted Mobile Radios
e Main Line Radio Discount: 38% off of list
o Accessories and Order Options: 15% off of list
o Repair Parts: 10% off of list
e Service Repair: $90.00/hour

Group 3: Desktop, Analog & Digital Base Radios
e Main Line Radio Discount: 38% off of list

o Accessories and Order Options: 15% off of list
¢ Repair Parts: 10% off of list
e Service Repair: $90.00/hour

Group 4: Analog & Digital Portable Radios
e Main Line Radio Discount: 38% off of list
e Accessories and Order Options: 15% off of list
e  Repair Parts: 10% off of list
e Service Repair: $90.00/hour

Group 6: Analog & Digital Base/Mobile Relay Station Fixed Radio (repeaters)
e Main Line Radio Discount: 32% off of list

o Accessories and Order Options: 15% off of list
e Repair Parts: 10% off of list
e Service Repair: $90.00/hour

Group 8: Fixed Link Base Radios
e Main Line Radio Discount: 25% off of list
e Accessories and Order Options: 10% off of list
e Repair Parts: (no bid, no contract)
e Service Repair: $90.00/hour

Group 9: Low Power, Vehicular Repeater
e Main Line Radio Discount: 35% off of list

e Accessories and Order Options: 15% off of list
s Repair Parts: (no bid, no contract)
s Service Repair: $90.00/hour

items NOT on Creative’s state contract, and must be bid as MR:
¢ Group 2: Mobile Data Radio, Vehicular Mounted (no bid, no contract)
e Group 5: Motorcycle Radios (no bid, no contract)



e Group 7: Communication Service Monitors {no bid, no contract)
e Group 10: Multi-Band Radios {no bid, no contract)



EXHIBIT C
AGREEMENT WITH
CREATIVE COMMUNICATIONS SALES & RENTALS, INC.
FOR

Installation and Repairs on Two-Way Radios

DISPUTE RESOLUTION

1. Disputes.

11

Commitment. The parties commit to tesolving all disputes promptly, equitably, and in a good-
faith, cost-effective mannet.

1.2 Application. The provisions of this Exhibit will be used by the parties to resolve all controversies,
claims, ot disputes ("Dispute") arising out of or telated to this Agteement-including Disputes
tegarding any alleged breaches of this Agreement.

1.3 Initiation. A patty may initiate 2 Dispute by delivery of written notice of the Dispute, including the
specifics of the Dispute, to the Representative of the other party as required in this Agreement.

14 Informal Resolution. When a Dispute notice is given, the parties will designate a membert of their
senior management who will be authorized to expeditiously resolve the Dispute.

a, The patties will provide each other with reasonable access during normal business houts to
any and all non-privileged records, information and data pertaining to any Dispute in order
to assist in resolving the Dispute as expeditiously and cost effectively as possible;

b. The patties' senior managers will meet within 10 business days to discuss and attempt to
resolve the Dispute promptly, equitably, and in a good faith manner, and

c The Senior Managers will agree to subsequent meetings if both parties agree that further
meetings are necessaty to reach a resolution of the Dispute.

2. Arbitration.

21 Rules. If the patties ate unable to tesolve the Dispute by negotiation within 30 days from the
Dispute notice, and unless otherwise informal discussions ate extended by the mutual agreement,
the patties may agtee, in writing, that the Dispute will be decided by binding atbitration in
accordance with Commetcial Rules of the AAA, as amended herein. Although the arbitration will
be conducted in accordance with AAA Rules, it will not be administered by the AAA, but will be
heard independently.

. The parties will exercise best efforts to select an arbitrator within 5 business days after
agreement for arbitration. If the parties have not agreed upon an arbitrator within this
petiod, the parties will submit the selection of the arbitrator to one of the ptincipals of the
mediation firm of Scott & Skelly, LLC, who will then select the arbitrator. The parties will
equally share the fees and costs incutred in the selection of the atbitrator.

b. The atbitrator selected must be an attorney with at least 10 years expetience, be
independent, impartial, and not have engaged in any business for or advetse to either Party
for at least 10 years.

22

Discovery. The extent and the time set for discovery will be as detetmined by the atbitrator. Each
Party must, however, within ten (10) days of selection of an atbitrator deliver to the other Party
copies of all documents in the delivering party's possession that are relevant to the dispute.




2.3

24

25

2.6

Heating, The atbitration hearing will be held within 90 days of the appointment of the atbitrator.
The arbitration heating, all proceedings, and all discovery will be conducted in Glendale, Arizona
unless otherwise agreed by the parties or required as a result of witness location. Telephonic
hearings and other reasonable arrangements may be used to minimize costs.

Award. At the arbitration heating, each Party will submit its position to the arbitrator, evidence to
suppott that position, and the exact award sought in this matter with specificity. The arbitrator
must select the award sought by one of the parties as the final judgment and may not independently
alter or modify the awards sought by the parties, fashion any remedy, ot make any equitable order.
The atbitrator has no authotity to consider or award punitive damages.

Final Decision. The Atbitratot's decision should be rendered within 15 days after the atbitration
hearing is concluded. This decision will be final and binding on the Patties.

Costs. The ptevailing party may enter the arbitration in any court having jurisdiction in otder to
convett it to a judgment. The non-prevailing patty shall pay all of the prevailing party's atbitration
costs and expenses, including reasonable attorney's fees and costs.

Services to Continue Pending Dispute. Unless otherwise agreed to in writing, Contractor must continue
to petform and maintain progress of required services duting any Dispute resolution or atbitration
proceedings, and City will continue to make payment to Conttactot in accordance with this Agreement.

Exceptions.

4.1

4.2

4.3

Thitd Party Claims. City and Contractor ate not required to atbitrate any third-party claim, cross-
claim, counter claim, or other claim or defense of a third-party who is not obligated by contract to
arbitrate disputes with City and Contractot.

Liens. City ot Contractot may commence and prosecute a civil action to contest a lien ot stop
notice, ot enforce any lien or stop notice, but only to the extent the lien or stop notice the Patty
seeks to enforce is enforceable under Arizona Law, including, without limitation, an action undet
AR.S. § 33-420, without the necessity of initiating or exhausting the procedures of this Exhibit.

Governmental Actions. This Exhibit does not apply to, and must not be construed to tequite
atbitration of, any claims, actions ot other process filed ot issued by City of Glendale Building
Safety Department or any other agency of City acting in its governmental permitting ot other
regulatory capacity.

-14-
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