uis C-9287
Al 10/14/2014

ACCEPTAMCE AGREEMENT

INVITATION FOR BID NO. IFB 14-36
DESCRIPTION: RESIDENTIAL WATER METERS

1, This is to notify you that on October 14, 2014, the Glendale City Council will be voting to award IFB
14-36 to your company, Badger Meter, Inc.

2. This notification constitutes an acceptance of your offer to provide the materials listed on the Price
Sheet. All terms and conditions of the IFB shall apply.

3. The term of this Agreement shall be for two (2) years initial period with the option of the City and with
the approval of the Contractor to extend this agreement for three (3) additional years In one (1) year
increments based on satisfactory Contract performance.

4, A contract administrator shall administer the Agreement for the City. The contract administrator for
the City shall be Anthony Weathersby.

5.  This Agreement does not constitute a commitment to purchase on the part of the City of Glendale.

6. You are required to sign and return this Agreement within 10 days from the date of this notice. Failure
to furnish a signed a copy of this document to the City of Glendale will be considered a default. The
City shall be entitled to such rights as may be granted by law,

OFFER
The Undersigned hereby offers and agrees to furnish the material or service in compliance with all terms,
conditions, specifications and amendments in the Solicitation and any written ptions in theoffer.

# '

Contractor Name: BADGER METER, Inc. Contractor Signature: szafffxf"’

Company Address: 4545 W. Brown DeerRd  Printed Name and Title: TMMM&
ukee, W) 5322 Email Address: ids@bad te

ACCCEPTANCE OF OFFER
The Offer is hereby accepted. The Contractor Is now bound to sell the materials or services specified in the
Agreement, including all terms and conditions, specifications, addenda, etc. Contractor Is cautioned not to
provide any material or service under this contract until Cont ives a Purchase Order.

City of Glendale City Manager or Designee Signature;

Printed Name and Tltle: renda S. er or B n
Date: L | 141 1

Approved as to form

M ” City Clerk
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FINANCE DEPARTMENT/MATERIALS
MANAGEMENT

IFB NAME: RESIDENTIAL WATER METERS

IFB NO.: 14-36 HD Suool
upply
DUE DATE: June 2, 2014 Badger Meter
Waterworks, LTD g
CONTRACT ANALYST: Elmer Garcia )
ITEM ESTIMATED | UNIT OF EXTENDED EXTENDED
NO. DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | MEASURE || UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE
(A) (8) (A XB) (B) (AXB)
Lot A: Water Meters * *
5.1 |5/8" x3/4" Meter with Direct Read Register 6700 EACH $43 53 $291,651.000 $5432 | - $363,944 0
5.2 [3/4” Meter with Direct Read Register 2100 EACH $64 71 $135,891.000 $7007 - $147,147 00
5.3 |1" Meter with Direct Read Register 6950 EACH $97 65 $678,667.500 $11376 |- . $790,632 0
5.4 |1-1/2" Meter with Direct Read Register 340 EACH $26471 $90,001 40ff $254 10 $86,394.,
5.5 [2" Meter with Direct Read Register 445 EACH $370 59 $164,912 55 $357 51 $159,091.9
Sub-Total {item 5.1 thru 5.5) $1,361,123.45 $1,547,208.95}
Lot B: ITRON Electronic Radio Transmitter (ERT)
5.6 |ITRON 60w ERT with In-Line Connector 2500 EACH No Bid No Bid $90 00 $225,000.00||
Sub-Total (Item 5.6) No Bid $225,000.00
L $1,361,123.45 $1,772,208.95

Award Determination:

Award is recommended to: Badger Meter for items 5.1, 5.2, 5.3, 5.4, 5.5 and 5.6

Badger Meter i1s determined to be responsive, responsible and 1s the lowest bidder in
each respective category

% HD Water Supply Works LTD's offer was deemed non-responsive Water meters
offered by HD Water Supply Works, LTD were manufactured by Neptune
Technology Group and have not yet undergone a three-year field test by the City




Notice of Intent to Award

July 15,2014

IFB Number: 14-36, Residential Water Meters

Thank you for participating and submitting an offer on the above solicitation. We appreciate your
interest in doing busiess with the City of Glendale and trust that there will be opportumities in the
future for your continued participation.

The City has completed the evaluation process of the offers received. The recommended award for
this solicitation is to Badger Meter, whose bid was determined to be the lowest responsible and
responsive bid.

If you have any questions, or would like further information about the award, please contact me by
on or before July 22, 2014

ey

Elmer Garcia, CPPB
Contract Analyst
egarcial @glendaleaz.com

City of Glendale
5850 West Glendale Avenue, Sumte 317, Glendale, Anizona 85301-2599
Tel (623) 930-2862 Fax (623) 915-2861
www glendaleaz com



Py CITY OF GLENDALE
Ak MATERIALS MANAGEMENT
GLENDAE INVITATION FOR BIDS

SOLICITATION NUMBER: IFB 14-36
DESCRIPTION: RESIDENTIAL WATER METERS

OFFER DUE DATE AND TIME: JUNE 2, 2014, AT 2:00 P.M. LOCAL TIME

Offers for the materials or services specified shall be received by the City of Glendale, Materials
Management at the specified due date, time and location Offers received by the correct time and date will
be opened and the name of each bidder and the amount of the bid will be publicly read.

SUBMITTAL LOCATION: City of Glendale
Materials Management
5850 West Glendale Avenue, Suite 317
Glendale, Arizona 85301

Offers must be 1n the actual possession of Materials Management on or prior to the time and date, and at
the location indicated above. Materials Management 1s located on the 3™ floor of the Glendale Municipal
Office Complex (City Hall) behind the Engineering Department Offers are accepted from the hours of
8:00 a m. and 5:00 p.m., Monday through Friday, unless otherwise indicated for a holiday. All offers will
be time stamped at the Engineering Department’s front counter. Late offers will not be considered.

The City of Glendale offices will be closed on May 26, 2014 1n recogmition of Memoral Day. Offices
will return to regular hours on May 27, 2014.

Offers must be submitted m a sealed envelope with the Solicitation Number and the Offeror’s name and
address clearly indicated on the envelope. See Paragraph 2.3 for additional instructions for preparing
an offer.

OFFERORS ARE STRONGLY ENCOURAGED TO CAREFULLY READ THE ENTIRE
SOLICITATION.

For questions regarding this solicitation contact:
Elmer Garcia, CPPB

Contract Analyst

623-930-2866

Egarcial @glendaleaz.com
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GLEND,%E RESIDENTIAL WATER METERS 5850 West Glendale

Avenue, Suite 317
Glendale, Arizona 85301

1.0

1.1

1.2

1.2.1

122

123

1.2.4

1.2.5

1.2.6

SPECIFICATIONS

INTRODUCTION

It 1s the intent of the City of Glendale to establish a term contract for the purchase of
residential water meters and replacement parts on an “as required” basis.

The resulting agreement shall provide for all materials in this contract. Unit pricing shall
include the cost of freight and any other associated direct or indirect costs, except taxes

The City reserves the right to make multiple awards or to award by individual line items,
by group of line items, or to make an aggregate award, whichever is deemed most
advantageous to the City. If the City determines that an aggregate award to one bidder is
not in the City’s best interest, “all or one” offers shall be rejected.

GENERAL SPECIFICATIONS

The City has a large installed base of water meters Replacement meters and parts are
needed on an “as required” basis to maintain this inventory base.

The quantities referenced on the Pricing Sheet, Section 5.0 are the City’s best estimates
and are to be used for information and evaluation purposes ONLY. Estimated quantities
do not obligate the City to order more than the City’s actual requirements and are subject
to availability of appropriated funds

The resultant agreement may be extended for use by other governmental agencies and
political subdivisions of the State, including all members of SAVE (Strategic Alliance for
Volume Expenditures). The resultant agreement may include cooperative purchases from
the following Arizona cities. City of Scottsdale, City of Tempe, and the City of Prescott
Estimated quantities from some of the cities are included in this solicitation.

Contractor shall provide a discount off of manufacturer’s list price from current catalog
or price book for the purchase of parts on an “as required” basis for all meters listed in
this solicitation.

Contractor should furnish current literature (specification sheets, etc ) describing each
meter they propose including any manufacturer warranties, guarantees and exchange
programs. Failure to comply with this requirement could result in rejection of bid
entirely

The bid price is an important factor in the evaluation of this bid. In general, the most
responsive, responsible bidder with the lowest price will be awarded. The City reserves
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Glendale, Arizona 85301

the right to examine other factors such as start-up costs, cost of maintenance, guarantees,

service, life expectancy, replacement costs, meter history, system compatibility and
delivery.

127 On occasion, the City shall test meters received from the contracted supplier. The City
reserves the right to return all meters delivered at the expense of the Contractor in the

event the Contractor’s inventory does not perform according to the documents set forth in
this bid

1.3 TECHNICAL SPECIFICATIONS
131 Meter sizes shall be 5/8” x 3/4",1”, 1 1/2", and 2.

132 All meters shall be the positive displacement magnetic drive type conforming to the latest
revision of the AWWA Standard C-700, C-800, NSF/ANSI Standard 61 Annex F & G
and Federal law except as herein amended Meters shall have a permanently and
hermetically “roll sealed” register reading in gallons. Register lid, register box and main
case shall be of bronze lead-free Alloy composition

1.3.3  Meter main case shall be made of bronze lead-free Alloy composition The compartment
that holds the register (register box) and lid shall also be made of bronze lead-free Alloy
5/8” x 3/4" and 1” meters shall have a bronze lead-free Alloy bottom plate design with
stainless steel bolts enabling access to the measuring chamber after the bottom plate has
been removed. Meters shall have cast on them in raised characters the size, model, NSF
61, and direction of flow. The manufacturer’s serial number shall also be imprinted on
the outer case of all meters.

1.3.4 The manufacturer/model numbers have been pre-approved for this solicitation. No
other models will be accepted. They are.

1341 Badger Meter Recordall Model 25LL — 5/8” x 3/4”
1342 Badger Meter Recordall Model 70LL - 1”

13.43 Badger Meter Recordall Model 120LL -1 1/2"
1344 Badger Meter Recordall Model 170LL - 2”

13.45 Badger Meter Recordall Model T160LL —1 1/2”
13.4.6 Badger Meter Recordall Model T200LL —2”
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1.35 Estimated annual quantities by City.

Size

Estimated Quantities

City of
Glendale

City of
Scottsdale

City of
Prescott

5/8” x 3/4"

4700

1700

300

3/4"

0

2100

0

1»»

3000

3750

200

112"

100

240

0

2”

100

315

30

1.4

141

1.5

1.5.1

1.6

161

MEASURING CHAMBERS

The measuring chamber shall be oscillating piston or nutating disc m design. All meters
shall have an outer case with a separate measuring chamber in which the piston or disc
operates

REGISTERS

All registers shall read in gallons. Registers shall be of magnetic drive type and shall be
permanently and hermetically “roll sealed” by the manufacturer. Register lens shall be
made of glass and shall resist breakage under normal working conditions. All registers
shall contain standard reduction gearing for each size meter furnished enabling register
interchangeability. In addition to the register sweep hand, all registers shall contain a low
flow leak detector indicator Register magnets shall have sufficient torque to assure
positive drive between the piston/disc and register at all times. Registers must be secured
in an acceptable tamper-proof manner. The cities may purchase one of two types of
registers’

151.1
1.5.1.2

Direct Read register
Encoded register

ELECTRONIC RADIO TRANSMITTERS (ERT)

The cities may purchase encoded registers that successfully interface with the Itron
Automated Meter Reading electronic radio transmitter (ERT) 60W series The cable
connecting the ERT in line connector and the meter shall be equipped with an adaptor.
The cable shall be 5-12 feet in length for all 2” meters or smaller. For meters 3” and
larger, 25 foot cable is required.
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1.7 GUARANTEES AND EXCHANGE PROGRAMS

1.7.1 Guarantees and exchange programs are a critical consideration 1n the overall cost of
purchasing and operating a water meter. Contractor 1s requested to supply their current
guarantees, parts hist, and exchange programs for those products supplied. Guarantees
and exchange programs must be part of the manufacturer’s national policy and should not
be unique to this bid. The following standards are the mimmum acceptable by the City.

1.72 5/8° x 3/4", and 1” meters. AWWA new meter standards for one year. AWWA repaired
meter standards for the following 14 years

1.73 11/2" and 2” meters Guaranteed for one year for materials and workmanship
1 7.4 Regsters. 25 years performance.
1.8 TRAINING

1 8.1 Contractor shall provide hands-on training on meter repair and calibration within six
months of award.

1.9 TESTING

19.1 The City of Glendale encourages the development and introduction of new products that
are not currently approved for the City’s water system. If the Contractor desires to
introduce new meters to the City, the Contractor may, at its own expense, supply the City
with a minimum of 30 sample meters to undergo a three-year field test:

QTY: 12-3/4"x 5/8” meters

QTY: 10— 1” meters

QTY: 2 -1 1/2" positive displacement meters
QTY: 2 -27 positive displacement meters
QTY: 2 -1 1/2" turbine meters

QTY" 2 -2” turbine meters

The meters will be placed m various parts of the city water system and tested every six
months. At the end of the three-year period, they will be evaluated for accuracy, wear,
system compatibility, etc. and then returned to the Contractor. If it is determined that the
meters perform well and is compatible with the city water system, it will be added to the
list of acceptable products for the next bid
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2.0

21

2.2

2.3

24

25

SPECIAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS

INCORPORATION BY REFERENCE All responses shall incorporate by reference
the Specifications, terms and conditions, general instructions and conditions and any
attachments The Standard Terms and Conditions applicable to this solicitation are
posted on the Internet. They are available for review and download at the City’s
Materials Management Internet home page, www glendaleaz com/purchasing. Offerors
are advised to review all provisions of the General Instructions and Conditions for this
solicitation.

RETURN OF OFFER One (1) original copy of the proposal response and one (1)
flash drive or CD-ROM containing all original documents shall be submitted. The
original copy of the proposal should be clearly labeled “Original” and shall be
single-sided.”

The Offeror shall complete all sections of the IFB in the format and spaces
provided. If additional space is needed than what is given, enter “See attachment
for detail.”

PREPARATION OF OFFER PACKAGE The following items shall be completed and

returned Failure to include all the items may result in an offer being rejected. Offer

packages shall be submutted 1n the following order

2.3.1 OFFER SHEET, Section 4 0

2.3.2 PRICE SHEET, Section 5.0

2.3.3 SOLICITATION ADDENDUM, (if applicable).

2.34 SPECIFICATIONS AND ADDITIONAL SUBMISSION REQUIREMENTS,
Section 1 0 and 3 0

ALTERNATE OFFERS/EXCEPTIONS Offers submitted as alternates, or on the basis
of exceptions to specific conditions of purchase and/or required specifications, must be
submitted as an attachment referencing the specific paragraph number(s) and adequately
defining the alternate or exception submitted. Detailed product brochures and/or
technical literature, suitable for evaluation, must be submitted with the offer. If no
exceptions are taken, City will expect and require complete compliance with the
specifications and all conditions of purchase

EVALUATION CRITERIA Invitation for Bids are awarded to the lowest responsible
and responsive bidder whose bid conforms in all material respect to the requirements and
criteria set forth in the Invitation for Bids.
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2.6 INQUIRIES Any question related to the Invitation for Bid shall be directed to the
Contract Officer whose name appears above A Contractor shall not contact or ask
questions of the department for whom the requirement is bemng procured. The Contract
Officer may require any and all questions be submitted in writing. Contractors are
encouraged to submit written questions via electronic mail or facsimile, at least five days
prior to the proposal due date. Any correspondence related to a solicitation should refer to
the appropriate IFB page and paragraph number An envelope contaming questions
should be identified as such; otherwise it may not be opened until after the official
proposal due date and time. Oral mterpretations or clarifications will be without legal
effect Only questions answered by a formal written amendment to the IFB will be
binding.

2.7  PRICE All prices quoted shall be firm and fixed for the specified contract period. All
pricing shall be firm for the initial term of two (2) years and include all freight, insurance,
warranty and any other associated direct or indirect costs, except taxes. The City shall
not be invoiced at prices higher than those stated in any contract resulting from this bid.

The Contractor certifies that the prices offered are no higher than the lowest price the
Contractor charges other buyers for similar quantities under similar conditions. The
Contractor further agrees that any reductions in the price of the goods or services covered
by this bid and occurring after award will apply to the undelivered balance. The
Contractor shall promptly notify the City of such price reductions

No fuel surcharges will be accepted. No price increases will be accepted without proper
request by Contractor and response by the City’s Purchasing Division.

2.8 FOB POINT_ Prices quoted shall be FOB destination to: City of Glendale and/or
participating S.A V.E. cooperative member.

2.9 TERM OF AGREEMENT The initial term of the contract shall be two (2) years upon
approval by the City Council.

2.10 OPTION TO EXTEND The City may, at its option and with the approval of the
Contractor, extend the term of this agreement for three (3) additional years mn one (1) year
increments based on satisfactory Contractor performance. Contractor shall be notified in
writing by the City Materials Manager of the City's intention to extend the contract
period at least 30 calendar days prior to the expiration of the original contract period.
Price adjustments will only be reviewed during contract renewal.

2.11 EVALUATION LITERATURE Offers submitted for products considered by the seller
to be equal to or better than the brand names or manufacturer's catalog references
specified herein, must be submitted with technical literature and/or detailed product
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2.12

brochures with written statements if the literature or brochure is not specific as to the
specification for the City's use to evaluate the product(s) offered Offers submitted
without this product information may be considered as non-responsive and rejected

INSURANCE Contractor, performing as an independent contractor hereunder, shall be
fully responsible for providing Workers’ Compensation or other applicable insurance
coverage for itself and its employees and the City shall have no responsibility of Liability
for such msurance coverage.

Contractor shall provide to the City a copy of the policy or a certification by the
msurance carrier along with the applicable endorsements showing the Contractor to have
in effect during the term of this contract, a General Liability Insurance policy, which shall
be the primary coverage for Contractor activities under this contract The coverage limits
of such insurance shall not be less than those listed below.

The msurance company issuing the policy required above shall have an AM Best
financial rating of “A- VII” or better and be authorized by the State of Arizona
Department of Insurance to transact business within the State. The certificate and
policy shall name the City, its officers, directors, employees, agents and assignees as
an additional insured and shall be primary and non-contributory for any insurance
and/or self-insurance coverage maintained by the City. The City shall also be an
additional insured to the full limits of the liability insurance purchased by the
Contractor even if those limits are in excess of those required by this contract.

The City reserves the right to terminate any Contractor agreement if the Contractor fails
to maintain such insurance coverage.

Contractor hereby grants to City a waiver of any right to subrogation which any msurer
of said Contractor may acquire against the City by virtue of the payment of any loss
under such msurance Contractor agrees to obtain any endorsement that may be
necessary to effect this warver of subrogation, but this provision applies regardless of
whether or not the City has received a waiver of subrogation endorsement from the
insurer

Contractor must provide certification of insurance and amendatory endorsements or
copies of the applicable policy language providing the insurance coverage required
below. All certificates and endorsements are to be received and approved by the City
within ten (10) calendar days after notification of award. Certification must mclude:
name and address of insurance company, policy number; liability coverage amounts, a
statement the policy will not be canceled or failed to be renewed without ten (10) days
written notice to the City
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Certification to be submitted to: Materials Management, 5850 West Glendale Avenue,
Suite 317, Glendale, Arizona 85301.

Type of Insurance Limuts of Liability
(Mmimum)
Workers’ Compensation Statutory
Employer’s Liability
Each Accident $1,000,000
Disease-Each Employee $1,000,000
Disease-Policy Limit $1,000,000

Commercial General Liability shall cover liability arising from bodily injury, property
damage, products-completed operations, personal and advertising mjury, independent
Contractors, and broad form contractual coverage

Each Occurrence $2,000,000
Personal and Advertising $1,000,000
General Aggregate $4,000,000
Products-Completed Operations $2,000,000

Automobile Liability — Including bodily injury and property damage for any owned,
hired and non-owned vehicles used in the performance of the services

Combined Single Limit (CSL) $1,000,000

2.13 NOTICE OF INTENT TO AWARD Information about the recommended award for
this solicitation will be posted on the Internet The mformation will be available for
review on the City’s Materials Management Internet home  page
www.glendaleaz.com/purchasing immediately after the City has completed its evaluation
process of the offers received. If you have any questions, or would like further
information about an mtended award, contact the contract analyst immediately Any
protest must be submitted to the Materials Manager no later than seven (7) calendar days
from the date of posting on the Internet.

2.14 COOPERATIVE USE OF CONTRACT This agreement may be extended for use by
other governmental agencies and political subdivisions of the State, including all
members of SAVE (Strategic Alliance for Volume Expenditures). Any such usage by
other entities must be in accord with the ordinances, charter, rules and regulations of the
respective entity and the approval of the Contractor and City For a list of SAVE
members, click on the following link: http://www.maricopa gov/Materials/save.aspx.
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2.15 PERMITS AND LICENSES The Contractor shall be responsible for determiming and
securing, at his/her expense, any and all licenses and permuts that are required by any
statute, ordinance, rule or regulation of any regulatory body having jurisdiction m any
manner connected with providing products and services. Such fees shall be included in
and are part of the total offer cost During the term of the contract, the Contractor shall
notify the City in writing, within two (2) working days, of any suspension, revocation or
renewal

2.16 ADDITIONS/DELETIONS OF PRODUCTS OR SERVICES The City reserves the
right to add additional products to this contract when deemed necessary by the City. If
this occurs, the Contractor will be requested to submit a negotiable quotation for the
additions. Upon approval and authorization by the Materials Manager such additions will
be added to and become a part of the contract through properly executed forms.

2.17 ESTIMATED QUANTITIES Quantities listed are the City’s best estimate and do not
obligate the City to order or accept more than City’s actual requirements during the
period of this agreement as determined by actual needs and availability of appropriated
funds It is expressly understood and agreed that the resulting contract 1s to supply the
City with its complete actual requirements for the contract period, except that the
estimated quantity shown for each quotation item shall not be exceeded by 100 % without
the express written approval of the Materials Manager. Any demand or order made by
any employee or officer of the City, other than the Materials Manager, for quantities 1n
the excess of the estimated quantities shall be void if the written approval of the Materials
Manager was not received prior to the Contractors performance

2.18 EMERGENCY BUSINESS SERVICES During a natural disaster, or homeland
security event, there may be a need for the City to access your business for products or
services twenty-four (24) hours a day, seven (7) days a week, three hundred sixty-five
(365) days a year. The need could be for a pick up or a delivery.

For this purpose, a primary and secondary emergency contact name and phone number
are required from the Contractor. It is critical to the City that the contactor’s emergency
contact information remains current. The Materials Management staff member,
identified on page 1, 1s to be contacted by E-mail with any change to a contact name or
phone number.

All products or services provided to meet an emergency phone request are to be supplied
as per the contract prices, terms and conditions. The Contractor may provide the fee
(pricing) for an after-hours emergency opening of the business separate from the Price
Sheet (Section 5.0) In general, the order will be placed using a City Procurement Card
The bulling is to include the emergency opening fee, if applicable.

10
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2.19

2.20

PUBLIC RECORD Contractor acknowledges that the City is a public agency and must
comply with all Public Records laws. All proposals submitted in response to the
Solicitation shall become the property of the City and, subsequent to award
recommendation, become a matter of public record available for review pursuant to
Arizona Public Records Law.

If a Contractor believes that a specific section of its Proposal response is confidential,
that should be withheld from the public record, Contractor shall isolate the pages and
mark each page confidential in a specific and clearly labeled section of its Proposal
response The Contractor shall include a written statement as to the basis for considering
the marked pages confidential including the specific harm or prejudice if disclosed. The
City Materials Management Division will review the material and make a determination
as to the confidentiality of any of the information and/or material contained within the
Submuttal. In the event of a public records request for documents Contractor deems
confidential, the City will notify Contractor of the request and 1f Contractor claims such
documents are confidential, it shall be the Contractor’s sole responsibility, including sole
cost, to take appropriate action, including legal action, to protect such documents.

NO CONTACT, NO INFLUENCE DURING THE RFP OR IFB PROCESS The
City is conducting a competitive bidding process for the contract, free from mmproper
influence or lobbymg. There shall be no contact concerning this solicitation from
Contractors submitting an offer with any member of the City Council, Evaluation
Committee Members, or anyone connected with the process for or on behalf of the City
Contact includes direct or indirect contact by the Contractor, its employees, attorneys,
lobbysts, surrogates, etc. in an attempt to mfluence the bidding process.

From the time the RFP or IFB is issued until the expiration of the protest period or the
resolution of any protest, whichever 1s later (the “Black-Out Period™), Contractors,
directly or indirectly through others, are restricted from attempting to influence in any
manner the decision making process through, including but not himited to, the use of paid
media, contacting or lobbying the City Council or City Manager or any other City
employee (other than Material Management employees); the use of any media for the
purpose of influencing the outcome; or in any other way that could be construed to
influence any part of the decision-making process about this RFP or IFB  This provision
shall not prohibit a Contractor from petitioning an elected official or engaging in any
other protected first amendment activity after the protest period has run or any protest has
been resolved, whichever is later.

Violation of this provision will cause the proposal or offer of the Contractor to be found
in violation and to be rejected

11
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221 KEY PERSONNEL Contractor shall assign specific individuals to the key positions m

support of the Contract. Once assigned to work under the Contract, key personnel shall
not be removed or replaced without the prior written approval of the City Upon the
replacement of any key personnel, Contractor shall submit the name(s) and qualifications
of any new key personnel to the City Contract Admuustrator or Designee. With the
concurrence of the Contract Admimstrator or Designee, the City shall amend the Contract
to reflect the name(s) of any replacement key personnel Upon any unplanned departure
of key personnel, Contractor shall immediately notify the Contract Admunistrator or
Designee

12




rg!, Solicitation Number: IFB 14-36 CITY OF GLENDALE

h Materials Management
5850 West Glendale
GLEN%LE RESIDENTIAL WATER METERS Avenne, Suite 317

Glendale, Arizona 85301

3.0

3.1

3.2

ADDITIONAL SUBMISSION REQUIREMENTS

Contractor shall provide three (3) references from companies for whom Contractor has
provided similar products/services in the last five years. Include company name, address,
phone number, email address, contract person, a description of the products/services
provided.

Contractor is requested to supply their current guarantees, parts list, and exchange
programs for those products supplied. Guarantees and exchange programs must be part
of the manufacturer’s national policy and should not be unique to this bid.

13




!‘z. Solicitation Number: IFB 14-36 CITY OF GLENDALE

Materials Management
RESIDENTIAL WATER METERS 5150 West Glendale
venue, Suite 317
Glendale, Arizona 85301
4.0 OFFER SHEET

4.1 OFFER Offeror certifies that they have read, understand, and will fully and faithfully comply
with this solicitation, 1ts attachments and any referenced documents. Offeror also certifies that the prices
offered were independently developed without consultation with any of the other Offerors or potential
Offerors,

N Badger Meter, Inc.

Authorized Signa Company's Legal Name
Theresa M. Szafranski 4545 West Brown Deer Road
Printed Name Address
Assistant Secretary Milwaukee, Wi 53223
Title City, State & Zip Code
800-876-3837 x15986 bids@badgermeter.com
Telephone Number Email Address
blds@baggemeter.com May 29, 2014
Authorized Signature Email Address Date

For questions regarding this offer: (If different from above)

Contact Name Phone Number Fax Number

Email Address

FEDERAL TAXPAYER ID NUMBER: -

Offeror certifies it is a. Proprietorship Partnership Corporation _X

Minority or woman owned business: Yes No_X

14



ro s, Solicitation Number: IFB 14-36 CITY OF GLENDALE
. Materials Management
GLENQQE RESIDENTIAL WATER METERS 5850 West Glendale
Avenue, Suite 317
Glendale, Arizona 85301
5.0 PRICE SHEET
LOT A: WATER METERS
ESTIMATED EXTENDED
ITEM | QUANTITY UNIT OF DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE PRICE
NO. (A) MEASURE (B) (AXB)
5/8” X 3/4” Meter with Direct
Read Register
5.1 6700 EACH § 5432 $ 363,944.00
Manufacturer: Badger Meter
DL VIoGeT 25, Tead-free bronz
Product No. l';ottom gng hou’:s:e:g‘ Ic;ce:l reggf ss connections
3/4” Meter with Direct Read
Register
5.2 2100 EACH $ 70.07 $ 147,147.00
Manufacturer: Badger Meter
Product No. 33%9." ggg lh%ﬁs‘ﬁ\ad]gggl lf?égg,zﬁhss connections
1” Meter with Direct Read
Register
5.3 6950 EACH $ 11376 $ 790,63200
Manufacturer; Badger Meter
Product No. gottom gnd housﬁngg Iorgal regg,z less connections
1-1/2” Meter with Direct Read
Register
5.4 340 EACH § 25410 |§ 86,394.00
Manufacturer: Badger Meter
Product No RDCL Model 120, lead-free brgt?u es
2” Meter with Direct Read
Register
5.5 445 EACH $ 35751 |$ 159,091.95
Manufacturer: Badger Meter
Product NO. RDCL Model 170, iead-free brgn gns
Sub-Total (Item 5.1 thru 5.5) | $1.547,208 95

15




ro Solicitation Number: IFB 14-36 CITY OF GLENDALE
h Materials Management
5850 West Glendale
GLEND;%E RESIDENTIAL WATER METERS Avenue, Suite 317
Glendale, Arizona 85301
LOT B: ITRON Electronic Radio Transmitter (ERT)
ESTIMATED EXTENDED
ITEM | QUANTITY | UNIT OF DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE PRICE
NO. (A) MEASURE B) (AXB)
ITRON 60W ERT with In-line
5.6 2500 EACH Connector
$ 90.00 $ 225,000 00
Product No. 100W+ £RT with in-line connectJ r
Sub-Total (Item 5.6) $ 225,000.00
Sub-Total (Item 5.1 thru 5.5) | § 1,547,208.95
Sub-Total (Item 5.6) $ 225,000.00
Grand Total (Item 5.1 thru 5.6) | $ 1,772,208 35
5.7 TAX AMOUNT Contractor should not include any use tax or federal tax in their bid

price. The City is exempt from the payment of federal excise tax and will add use tax as
applicable. For the purpose of determining the lowest cost, the City will not take tax into

consideration.
Tax %:_ 9 2%
5.8 DELIVERY All items shall be delivered within 30 calendar days after receipt of order
(ARO).
59 OPTIONAL ITEMS Contractor shall provide pricing for the following parts and
accessories.
ITEM UNIT OF DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE
NO. MEASURE
5.9.1 EACH | 5/8” x 3/4” Meter with Encoded Register
Manufacturer:_Badger Meter $ 9517
Product No. RDCL Model zsi Iead—fre'e b_ronzg ganel\:}s&?gracr;% {;o‘ig;nco nections
5.9.2 EACH 3/4” Meter with Encoded Register

16




r Y, Solicitation Number: IFB 14-36 CITY OF GLENDALE
h Materials Management
5850 West Glendale
GLEND,%E RESIDENTIAL WATER METERS Ao, Sulte 317
Glendale, Arizona 85301
Manufacturer: Badger Meter
Product No.roCL Model 35, lead-free bronze housing and bottom $ 110.92
with ADE encoder and 5' in-line connector cable, less connections
5.93 EACH 17 Meter with Encoded Register
Manufacturer: Badger Meter $ 15461
Product No. Rﬁb Model 70, lead-freq bﬁnze housxn oar?:g t?loqess coinections
5.94 EACH 1-1/2” Meter with Encoded Register
Manufacturer: Badger Meter $ 294.95
T Model 120, Tead-free bronz -
Product No. hcodtoani s inime conmecier caute, s connections
5.9.5 EACH 2” Meter with Encoded Register
Manufacturer: Badger Meter $ 39836
Product No. RDCL Model 170, Iead -free bron?iahﬁglsllzgsv:gg r{z‘itE'ons
5.9.6 EACH Encoded Register for 5/8” x 3/4” Meter
Manufacturer; Badger Meter
Product No. ADE encoder with 5' in-line connector cable for Model 25
5.9.7 EACH Encoded Register for 3/4” Meter
Manufacturer: Badger Meter $ 5098
Product No. ADE encoder with 5' in-line connector cable for Model 35
598 EACH Encoded Register for 1” Meter
Manufacturer: Badger Meter s 50.98
Product No. ADE encoder with 5' in-line connector cable for Model 70
5.9.9 EACH Encoded Register for 3” & larger Turbo Meters
Manufacturer: Badger Meter $ 70.00
Product No. ADE encoder with 25" in-line connector cable for 3" T-45( meter
Encoded Register for 3” & larger Compound
59.10| EACH | Meters
Manufacturer;_Badger Meter $§ 14000
Product No. (2) ADE encoders with 25" in-line connector cable for 3" I-450 meter
5.9.11} EACH | ITRON 60W ERT with In-Line Connector
Product No. 100w+ ERT with in-line connector $ %000
5.9.12) EACH | 3” Turbo Meter, Local Register
Manufacturer: Badger Meter $ 599.06
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r¥3, Solicitation Number: IFB 14-36 CITY OF GLENDALE
h Materials Management
GL RESIDENTIAL WATER METERS 5850 West Glendale
Avenue, Suite 317
Glendale, Arizona 85301
Pl’OdllCt No. RCDL T-450, lead-free bronze, local read, less connection
5.9.13/ EACH | 4” Turbo Meter, Local Register
Manufacturer: Badger Meter $ 95378
Product No. RCDL T-1000, lead-free bronze, local read, less connectiofis
5.9.14 EACH 6” Turbo Meter, Local Register
Manufacturer: Badger Meter § 2456.12
Product No. RCDL T-2000, lead-free bronze, local read, less connectiogs
59.15| EACH 3” Compound Meter, with Encoded Register
Manufacturer: Badger Meter $ 1,616.76
Product No. RCDL Compound Series meter, lead-free bronze, ADE enc?der with 25' in-line conrjector,
essconnections
5.9.16] EACH | 4” Compound Meter, with Encoded Register
Manufacturer; Badger Meter $ 2,563.42
Product No. RCOL Compound Series meter, lead-free bronze, ADE encs ’Igggmnmdon
5.9.17  EACH 6” Compound Meter, with Encoded Register
Manufacturer; Badger Meter $ 365122 .-L
Product NO RCDL Compound Series meter, lead-free bronze, ADE encder with 25" in-line connector,
59.18| EACH | Digital Totalizer, Remote
Manufacturer: Badger Meter $§ nobid
Product No.
59.191 EACH Digital Totalizer and Flow Rate Indicator
Manufacturer: Badger Meter $ nobd
Product No.
3.9.20| EACH 3” Turbo Meter, Integral Strainer, Local Register
Manufacturer: Badger Meter $ 92020
Product NO.RCDL 1-450, lead-free bronze with integral stramer, local Jead, less connections
5.9.21 EACH 4” Turbo Meter, Integral Strainer, Local Register
Manufacturer: Badger Meter $ 1,383.90
Product No. RCDL T-1000, lead-free bronze with integral strainer, loc4l read, less connections

18




roy, Solicitation Number: IFB 14-36 CITY OF GLENDALE

Materials Management

Avenue, Suite 317
Glendale, Arizona 85301

h
GLEND,%E RESIDENTIAL WATER METERS 5850 West Glendale

If Contractor have current catalog or price book for replacement parts and accessories,
Contractor shall provide a discount off of manufacturer’s list price and submit the catalog
or price book with the offer.

Discount off of Manufacturer’s List Price: 15 %

The City reserves the right to accept or reject the optional items when deemed to be in the
best interest of the City. Upon acceptance by the City, the optional items, the catalog or
price book and the discount % shall become part of the agreement. No alterations,
modifications or updates shall be allowed to the catalog or price book without prior
approval by the City.

510 PROCUREMENT CARD ORDERING CAPABILITY Please check the appropriate
box.
[X] Yes, I will accept payment under this contract with the Procurement Card.
[[] No, I will not accept payment under this contract with the Procurement Card.
Company Name Badger Meter, Inc,
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BADGER METER, INC.

City of Glendale, AZ
May 29, 2014

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT OF ADDENDA
CITY OF GLENDALE
SOLICIATION NUMBER: IFB 14-36

+ To date, no addendums to the Solicitation have been received.



545 W Biown Deer Roag
) PO Box 2450356

adger Meter Milwai.ee, Wisconsin 33224-9536
414-355 0400 | R300-876-3537

www.hadaermaian.com

May 29, 2014 ‘ A @g ; G!Nﬁgﬂ
VIA FEDERAL EXPRESS ] -

City of Glendale

Materials Management

5850 West Glendale Avenue, Suite 317
Glendale, AZ 85301

Re: Solicitation Number: IFB 14-36 Residential Water Meters
Submittal Due: June 2, 2014 at 2:00 p.m.

Dear Sir or Madam:

This letter is attached to and becomes a part of our bid to furnish water meters, encoders and endpoints
to the City of Glendale, Arizona.

If this bid is awarded to Badger Meter and if acceptance is made by the City within ninety (90) days, the
prices quoted herein will remain firm for two (2) years.

Payment terms are net thirty (30) days.

As required by Section 2.2 and 2.3 of the specifications, hardcopy of the 1) Offer Sheet, 2) Price Sheets, 3)
Solicitation Addendum (if applicable) and 4) Specifications and Additional Submission Requirements are
attached, along with our product literature. The enclosed CD contains the following files:

Cover letter, delivery schedule, references, sample insurance certificate

Offer sheet

Price Sheet

Solicitation Addendum - none received

Specifications (section 1.0) and Additional Submission Requirements (section 3.0)

Product Literature, including: warranties, product data sheets, parts lists, parts price list and FDM
checklist/checklist guide for itron endpoints

Also, as requested in the Special Terms and Conditions, 2.18, if the need arises to contact Badger Meter for
emergency business services, please note the following points of contact:

o Primary: Badger Meter Technical/Customer Support: (800) 456-5023
o Secondary: Zac Cox, Badger Meter Account Manager: (414) 207-1449

Additionally, as requested in the specifications, page 5., 1.7 - Guarantees and Exchange Programs: Badger
Meter local registers and chambers qualify for our component exchange program and may receive up to an
additional 7% discount beyond your parts pricing.



BADGER METER, INC.

City of Glendale
Materials Management
May 29, 2014

Page | 2

Please note the following items:

« The local registers are bid with bronze alloy lids and shrouds. The registers are not in contact with
the drinking water, therefore the bronze alloy is not the same lead-free bronze alloy as used in the
meter housings.

¢ The Absolute Digital Encoder (ADE') registers will be supplied with a plastic lid and plastic shroud.

e The ADE is warranted to be free from defects in materials and workmanship, appearing within the
earlier of either: Ten (10) years after installation or ten (10) years and six (6) months after shipment
from Badger Meter.

e  Tosupport Itron’s change from Endpoint Link to Field Deployment Manager (FDM) software for
programming ERTs, the attached FDM Checklist (TDC-0942-115) should be completed and submitted
to ttron. If you have any questions regarding this process, please contact your Badger Meter sales
representative for more information.

e Itron has announced the release of the 100W+ series water ERT for both indoor and pit applications.
The 100W+ series endpoint utilizes the SCM+ message and will replace the current 100W product.
Update, upgrade and/or replacement of the Utility’s current Itron reading equipment and software,
as well as other utility systems to support the SCM+ message, may be required and is not a part of
this offer.

e QOur ability to provide a factory-programmed and tested 100W/100W+ solution 1s dependent on
receipt of and access to the Itron FDM file for the City of Glendale. All delivery lead times are also
dependent upon our receipt of the appropriate FDM files for programming.

e Update, upgrade and/or replacement of the Utility’s current Itron reading equipment and software,
as well as other utility systems, may be required to support ltron’s transition to the 100W+ series
ERTs and are not a part of this offer. Please refer to Itron SCM+ documentation for specific
information.

e Certification files can be provided to the City to help manage meter and endpoint inventory and to
maintain meter accuracy data. Upon request, we will provide an electronic format of this data to the
City’s designated user. Please note that our standard method of delivery is via electronic mail, and
any deviations from this format, or any custom file formats, will be considered on a time and material
basis. Please contact the Badger Meter Technical Support Group (1-800-456-5023) for more
information.

e Badger Meter continues to improve and redesign our products to provide our customers with state-
of-the-art technology solutions. Therefore, we reserve the right to provide our newest product
solutions as an alternative to the proposed products, provided the replacement products meet the
following requirements: are substantially similar, are at least of equal quality and performance, are in
conformance with the requirements in the applicable specifications, meet the actual needs or are
otherwise suitable for the intended use, and are priced at an amount that does not exceed the price
of the quoted products.



BADGER METER, INC.

City of Glendale
Materials Management
May 29, 2014

Page | 3

o Badger Meter will extend bid pricing to participating agencies based on similarly situated products,
including exact product specifications and similar quantities, as per this bid, providing those agencies
would qualify as Badger direct customers and are not authorized accounts to a Badger Distributor.

e Insurance: The cancellation clause on the certificate of insurance reflects the new ACORD
standard, and we regret that our insurer cannot modify it. However, our insurer assures us that
Badger Meter will receive notice of cancellation of the policies with ample time to provide the
City of Glendale notification per the bid specification. Therefore, Badger Meter will comply with
the bid requirement to give 10 days’ advanced notice of insurance cancellation, if, for some
unforeseen reason, we choose not to renew the policies at the levels required by the bid.

o Also, please note, Badger Meter has ample coverage to satisfy the City of Glendale’s concerns for
supply-only contracts. The following requirements are more appropriately utilized in
circumstances other than a supply-only contract:

- additional insured status;
- primary and non-contributory language; and
- waiver of subrogation

®  We have enclosed a sample of our Certificate of Liability insurance for your review. Please be advised
that this is the authorized Certificate of Insurance form currently being utilized in the insurance
industry. Our insurer is obligated to use this form should Badger Meter be awarded a contract with
the City.

In the event that you have any questions concerning our response, | can be reached by telephone at
(800) 876-3837, extension 15896, or via email at bids@badgermeter.com.

We would appreciate a copy of the bid results for our records. For your convenience, | have enclosed a self-
addressed, stamped envelope for return of the bid tabulation.

Badger Meter appreciates this opportunity to support the metering needs of the City of Glendale.

Sincerely,
BADGER METER, INC.

Alrcsa M./ Jlonal

Theresa M. Szafranski
Assistant Secretary

T™S/r
enclosures

cc: Zac Cox, Account Manager — Badger Meter
Alan Breese, Sales Support Manager — Badger Meter



BADGER METER, INC.

City of Glendale
Materials Management
May 29, 2014
Page | 4
DELIVERY SCHEDULE
. Item i -
Quantity te Description/Product Delivery - after receipt of
No. order (ARO)
5/8” x %” Meter with Direct Read
6700 5.1 Recordall Model 25 lead-free bronze housing and bottom, Up to 648 meters every 30
. . days ARO
local read, bronze lid and shroud , less connections
3/4” Meter with Direct Read -
2100 5.2 Recordall Model 35 lead-free bronze housing and bottom, up to 216 meters every 30
. . days ARO
local read, bronze lid and shroud, less connections
1” Meter with Direct Read —
6950 5.3 Recordall Mode! 70 lead-free bronze housing and bottom, up to 720 meters every 30
. . days ARO
local read, bronze lid and shroud, iess connections
1 1/2” Meter with Direct Read —
340 5.4 Recordall Model 120 lead-free bronze housing, local read — up to 28 meters every 30
. . days ARO
bronze lid and shroud, less connections
2" Meter with Direct Read —
445 5.5 Recordall Model 170 lead-free bronze housing, local read, up to 38 meters every 30
; . days ARO
bronze lid and shroud, less connections
. " up to 216 endpoints every 30
2500 5.6 Itron water endpoint, 100W+ days ARO
5/8”" x %" Meter with encoder register
tbd 59,1 Recordall Model 25 lead-free bronze housing and bottom, up to 648 meters every 30
e Absolute Digital Encoder (ADE®), 5’ lead with in-line days ARO
connector less connections
%" Meter with encoder register
tbd 5.9.2 Recordall Model 35 lead-free bronze housing and bottom, up to 216 meters every 30
, ot . days ARO
ADE, 5’ lead with in-line connector, less connections
1” Meter with encoder register
tbd 5.9.3 Recordall Model 70 lead-free bronze housing and bottom, up to 720 meters every 30
) e . days ARO
ADE, 5’ lead with in-line connector, less connections
1 1/2” Meter with encoder register
€ 30
tbd 5.9.4 Recordall Model 120 lead-free bronze housing, ADE, 5’ lead up to Zzgnit:;so very
with in-line connector, less connections ¥
2” Meter with encoder register
t
tbd 5.9.5 Recordall Model 170 lead-free bronze housing, ADE, 5’ lead up to 38‘;:2 ::; very 30
with in-line connector, less connections ¥
tbd 5.9.6 Encoded Register for 5/8” x %" meter up to 120 registers every 30
" ADE, 5’ lead with in-line connector for Model 25 days ARO
thd 597 Encoded Register for %” meter up to 120 registers every 30
- ADE, 5’ lead with in-line connector for Model 35 days ARO




BADGER METER, INC.

City of Glendale
Matenials Management
May 29, 2014
Page | 5
thd 598 Encoded Register for 1” meter up to 120 registers every 30
ADE, 5’ lead with in-line connector for Model 70 days ARO
thd 5.9.9 Encoded Register for 3” and larger turbo meters up to 120 registers every 30
ADE, 25’ lead with in-line connector for turbo series meters days ARO
Encoded Register for 3” and larger compound meters
(2) ADEs w/ 25’ leads with in-line connector for compound up to 120 registers every 30
tbhd 5.9.10 .
series meters days ARO
thd 5911 itron water endpoint, 100W+ * up to 216 endpoints every 30
days ARO
3” Turbo, local register
thd 5.9.12 Turbo Series T-450, lead-free bronze, local read, bronze up to 12 meters every 30
. . days ARO
lid/shroud, less connections
4" Turbo, local register up to 6 meters every 30 days
thd 5.9.13 Turbo Series T-1000, lead-free bronze, local read, bronze ARO
lid/shroud, less connections
6" Turbo, local register up to 2 meters every 30 days
thd 59.14 Turbo Series T-2000, lead-free bronze, local read, bronze ARO
lid/shroud, less connections
3” Compound Meter, with encoded register up to 6 meters every 30 days
tbd 5.9.15| Compound Series, lead-free bronze, (2) ADEs w/ 25’ leads ARO
with in-line connector, less connection
4” Compound Meter, with encoded register up to 4 meters every 30 days
thd 5.9.16 | Compound Series, lead-free bronze, (2) ADEs w/ 25’ leads ARO
with in-line connector, less connection
6” Compound Meter, with encoded register
thd 5.9.17 | Compound Series, lead-free bronze, (2) ADEs w/ 25’ leads uptod mete;;;very 30 days
with in-line connector, less connection
tbd 5.9.18 no bid no bid
thd 5.9.19 no bid no bid
3” Turbo Meter, Integral Strainer, Local Register up to 12 meters every 30
thd 5.9.20 | Turbo Series T-450 with integral strainer, lead-free bronze, days ARO
local read, bronze lid/shroud, less connections
4” Turbo Meter, Integral Strainer, Local Register up to 6 meters every 30 days
thd 5.9.21 | Turbo Series T-450 with integral strainer, lead-free bronze, ARO
local read, bronze lid/shroud, less connections

*delivery lead times are dependent upon our receipt of the appropriate FDM files for programming.




BADGER METER CUSTOMERS PURCHASING

Badger Meter

REFERENCES

454375 ¥ Broven Dawr Road

PO Bev 245038

philwauicee, Wisconsin 32224-95%
414-335-0400 | 200-676-3837

v badgermeial com

SIMILAR

PRODUCTS/SERVICES AS BID HEREIN IN THE LAST FIVE YEARS

-“Customer ~ |~ -Descriptionof.. ’
- . “Information | Customer Contact '"f"““‘“"" Products/Services Provided:
Clty of Scottsdale Dave Petty, Water Resources Recordall meters, sizes 5/8°, %",
Water Operations Administrator 1", 1 %" & 2" with Absolute

9312 N. 94" Street
Scottsdale, AZ 85258

email: dpetty@scottsdaleaz.gov
phone: (480) 312-5650

Digital Encoders (ADE®)

City of Phoenix

Water Services Department
138 E. Union Hills Drive
10255 N. 23" Avenue
Phoenix, AZ 85024

Ed Perez, Water Customer Services
Administrator

email: ed.perez@phoenix.gov
phone: (602) 262-6379

Recordall meters, sizes 5/8"
through 6" with ADEs

City of Yuma
Utilities Department
155 West 14" Street
Yuma, AZ 85364

Christie Egan, Meter Services
Coordinator

email: Christie egan@yumaaz gov
phone: (928) 373-4603

Recordall meters, sizes 5/8”
through 6" with Recordall
Transmitter Registers (RTR®)
and ORION® transmitters




AcOrD

CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE

DATE (MMIDDIYYYY)
12/30/2013

REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER, THIS
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED

certificate holder In lisu of such endorsement(s).

IMPORTANT: If the certificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(ies) must be endorsed. If SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to
the terms and conditions of the policy, certain policies may require an endorsement. A statement on this certificate does not confer rights to the

PRODUCER 1-414-443-0000 mm
Hays Companies of Wiscongin, Inc. [ PHONE [FAx
’ PHONE No
-MAIL
1200 North Mayfair Road, Suite 100 ADDRESS:
Milwaukee, WI 53226 INSURER(S) AFFORDING COVERAGE NAIC#
INSURER A+ TRAVELERS PROP CAS CO OF AMER 25674
INSURED INSURERE AMERICAN GUAR & LIAB INS 26247
Badger Meter, Inc.
INSURER C :
4545 West Brown Deer Road INSURERD .
Milwaukee, WI 53223 INSURER B
INSURERE -

COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER: 37822794

REVISION NUMBER:

e e e e e
THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD
INDICATED NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE PQOLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN (S SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS,
EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS

WeR TYPE OF INSURANCE DLIEUBR POLICY NUMBER Py P LIMITS
A | GENERAL LIABILITY Y660 26872023 TIL 14 01/01/14 01/01/15| pacH OCCURRENGE $ 1,000,000
X | 'DAMAGE TO RENTED
X | COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY | PREMISES (Fa opcurence) | § 3007000
J CLAIMS-MADE OCCUR MED EXP (Any one person) | § 10,000
|| PERSONAL & ADVINJURY | § 2000, 000
GENERAL AGGREGATE § 4,000,000
GEN'L AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER. PRODUCTS - COMPIOP AGG | § 2,000,000
X ] poucy [ ] o Loc $
A | AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY Y810 268J2035 TIL 14 01701714 01701715 comm SINGLE LIMIT ¢ 1,000,000
X | anvauto BODILY INJURY (Per person) | $
™| ALL OWNED SCHEDULED coide
| auTos AUTOS Bog:i.;"lmmt’;r; )¢
| X | HIRED AUTOS P | (Per sccident s
$
A |X |UMBRELLALIAB | X |oceur YSMCUP26872047-TIL-14 01/01/14 01/01/15| EACH OCCURRENCE $ 5,000,000
EXCESS LIAB CLAIMS-MADE AGGREGATE $5,000,000
DED | X l RETENTION§ 10,000 $
WORKERS COMPENSATION WC STATU- OTH-
B | AND EMPLOYERS: LABILITY v WC 9806273 02 01/01/14 01/01/15| X
ANY PROPRIETOR/PARTNER/EXECUTIVE E L_EACH ACCIDENT $ 500,000
OFFICER/MEMBER EXCLUDED? N/A
Mandatory in NH) EL DISEASE - EAEMPLOYEE] § 500,000
If yes, describe under [ 00,000
DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS below E L _DISEASE - POLICY LimiT | § 500,
DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS / LOCATIONS | VEHICLES (Attach ACORD 101, Addrtronal Remarks Schedule, if more apace is required)
CERTIFICATE HOLDER CANCELLATION

For Sample Use Only
For Supply Oaly Contracts

SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE
THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DELIVERED IN
ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS.

AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE

Q) 4

-
© 1988-2010 ACORD CORPORATION. Al rights reserved.
ACORD 25 (2010/05) The ACORD name and logo are registered marks of ACORD
diannewandel

37822794






